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letlpqelelion 
leis Nate 
► ~ 1963-64 Member -
eb1p 0r1Ye of Archie Mc­
Cord Poat (86 Is off to 
a (a11 s tart. 40'{, o( the 
mvmbcrship hu already 
paid their dues (or the 
coqatng year, and 1l look,; 
like the Polit 18' on lt11 
,itay to winning the <:old 
nonor Ribbon for the fifth 
y9ar In 6UCCCIH<lon. We 
lnvl\e all t:Uglble veter­
an.H to pay Utl ll VIHlt and 
to Ind out what The 
American Legion Ii; do­
Ing lo help all vclo'ianll 
MeeUngs arc h'cld at tho 
Legion Hall on Wa11hing­
ton St., nethpagu on . the 
second an<! fourth Thurs. 
o( the month, 

~ PoeC. bas entered 
a , team la the Nat111au , 
~ ' Bohrt• Lape 
~ -the flni-t(me, llDCI 
.. hoped that the .team 
wUI mu:o a nam<: for lt­
aeif and the Poi;t dw-llig 
Die CUIJEDg bowling eea-

- t ~· ,. .f ' ) .. f .... • ') 

aan. 

,Cabliq'; 
Pro•rems · · 
► An organization, Gam­
l>lor' s Anonymous ls of­
fering Its servJcoi; locally 

. for anyono who has a 
gambllng problem. Any­
one Interested should 
write P. o. BoX 286, 
Hempstead, N. Y. or 
phone 212 MU 9-7500. 

. At Bridgeport 
l t 'Thomas' Bosco of 18 · 
' Koewlck Lane, Plainview, 

Is currently' · attending 
ilummcr uesslon classes 

I at the Univers ity o( 
· BrldgcpPrt, nrldgeport , 

Connccllcut. 

1~--

Deans' Listi 
~ Pierre Swlclc, « gr11du· 
ate o( lllckRvllle lllgh 
School, Is on the Mass . 
InBtllute o( Technology 
Dean' e List, composed of 
tho upper third of undor­
gnadulltcs In scholnellc 
.t1tandlng, for tho J 9C3 

, spring term. ' 

F.l\.\~K J • . HY~ES (left). Re·celyer of 'f"!es for the Town• of 0}'.Ster Bay, 
receives Lgng Isl~d Lighting Company's S595,000 ·check In payment for 
the 11cond ha(f 01 LlLCO' s 1963 town property taxes, •DellverlnS the check 
for ~assau and Suffolk'~ largest taxpayer Is Joi-eph Deegan. :lJ..ILCO;l.s-
1l1tant commercial District :-.1ana"8r. · 

- E'.\IILY BIENl:::-:t't:.LIJ, co-owner o( ,\rt Forms Vnl mtted, discusses wllh 
artlsl Claire Shapiro (right), her oil, "G!rl With Doll.'' which will be on 
dlspl:1\' al ong wrth other pai ntings In a specl:1 I one-man show at the gallery, 

I (cv!tll.)wn P-.irkway, Hlcksvllle. r:,·1:rbody Ii- Invited to come on Saturday 
and Sund:ty , August li-18, between the hour. or l :00 :ind 610Q p.m. ,\l the 
$:lme time the grassy trip o! land behind the g-a!lery will rese.mble a " Green­
wlql\ Village" open-air e,d1lblt. ctolhesp!ns, cord and tacks will support 
orlginal drawings, colorful pn lntlngs. dl?slgns and other Imaginative work 
done by s tudents at • th!? sum.mer worki:ihops held at the gallery. (ln oue 
of rain the outdoor exhibit will be held dow:i ~ttitrs at th7 gallery.) , · 

Rebel GOP · 
For Bettin•! -
Th~ RepubllClln ·i:own 

Team for Beller Govern­
ment----

The three Republican la­
su1t,rcnt candidates seek"' 
Ing eOWtollmaii Beats on 
the Oyster l}ay Town 
Doard today came out 
Clrmly In favor o( a ref­
erendum on o!! - t~ck • 
belling. t • · 
In u Joint stalemen~ the 

three said: "Thg,re Is no 
other moral pr ,ethical 
t1ulullon than J,o let tbe 
pcuple . dcclde for them­
aches whether or not they 
want legallred belling as 
an aid tu tax · rel lef. lt. 
Is utmost Incredible that 
one man ~n set hlmBelf · 
us deity, '))rotector of the 
people ngulJ!Bl them -
selvot. nnct. ae ~n-omnip­
otent legtelator w h o 
knows the d'esfrcs o[ the 
community wlthuut con­
i;ulllng the pcopk." 

Ai;scmt,Jy Spc1:1 ~.c r Jos­
eph Carlino, whu 11!1; 0 Is 
h•Hd(•r of N:1t; 8al1' S ne­
puOllcuh party, hRR puo- · 
Bely scored ore .- track 
betting and the need for a 
r eferendum. He has Raid 
he knows OORt wbllt Is good· 
!or the people·. 

"Whether or not off­
traclc bclUng will 60ITI! 
the· problem of rising tax­
es ln Oyster nay Town • 
we· ao not know ' -- but 
we wlll fight as hnrd aa 
wc -ctm to give the 11t:ople 
nn opportunity lo dcclde 
for themtielves," the • 
statement suld. 

The three candidates. 
i;eektng p11rty designation 
In · the Sept· 5, primary 
against throe . Incumbent . 
GOI>crs. nro Arthur t.ovy· 
o( SyoHsct, George E. 
Ilallcy 'Jr. of !llcksvlllc 
und · Wllllam Musso ol 
Plainview. 
They have attacked the 

Incumbent councllm'Cn as 
party hacks who take or­
ders from polltlcnl boss­
es und httve vowed lo re­
turn town goverlU}lenl to 
thu people. 

Levy Is an lndu11trlal 
real estate consultant Ill 
Garden City; nnlley Is llll 
Cll&C\ltlVC with n Hurglcal 
supply Urm: and Musso 
IH a real c11tate broke'r..J 

• 1, . . . 
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UR. ANJJ .MRS. WILUAJI 
Ro1ntls1 formerly of 
UtdusvtJJe, wish tn an­
nounce &hie t,apgemeal of 
tllelr daupter. .ierrte 
Gall, to Alan KN or 
Unto.dale • .lerrte lR em­
ployed hy INA IIUluraDce 
Company In Hempatead 
aad Alan ls.um.ling Bol­
atra ~1 lltudJtias 

. Cllnllcal £ag1Goe.rtag. 

lais-list 
' Jlla-Clletro.60..-•m ea.1. Plafm"" ..... . 

llltie Times . = :~.::-, = , 
fflck8'11Je Theatre _ -- fol' aeadeaiio aclldeft­
Wednesday thru Tuesday a,ent during the Sgwlg. 
August 14 thru 20, Ti.; 1963, acmcet.er. , 
Longes t Day, 2:00, 5:30, , 
9:00. ~ 
Skouras Cove - Friday d:f •l'IJ 
and Saturday. 8/16. 17~ ...,. .... ~~ 
Irma Lil Douce, 12:30, • .;.;.;;:.;==:.::.=.,:,;:;::.._ 
3:10;5:50, 11:10. 
Sunday . ·lhru TUefJdiy , 
August 18 lhru 20 - Jr~ 
La , Oouoe.l 1:-C0,. 4:30, 
7:20, 10:lu. 1 • ,. 
Pfnc Hollow Theatre -
Thursday, Aug. 15, -For 
,Love or Money, 1:30, 
3:25, 5:10, 7:25, 9:35 . 
Prlday andSatUl'day,Aog. 
16 and 17 - For Love or 
Money, 1:50. 4:00, 6:10, 
8:25, 10:35, 
Sunday thru Tuesday, 
August 18 thru 20 r For 
Love or· Money, 1:30, 
3:25, 5:10, 7:25, 9:35. 

DRIVE SAFELYi 
•= 4 ; I 

PIN£ 
HOLLOW 
"'-"Hen...,• 
... , (lit 106)1 

°"'" ••'{ I WA ,,ou , I Cic 'l'OUNG 

"FOR LOVE OR MOHU" 

tfl "#. ~ JUI IJI Q&'t 

f"a/ UJftl ll h f.AV 
llf S IN JMt •rtl( ,, .. ~ 

lltld Ottt Ttio, T uu . AiJ,- 20 

Oarryl r. Z.nueli's 

THE 
LONGEST 

DAY 

With 42 lAttrni!J0111t SIJts! 

AMUtff-S •ua. PerlOlm,ntH 
Dt lty,t 2 - 5:30 J 9P..M. 

, Ptlcu Sll&hlly lncruscd f or 
• This lng,gtiMflt Only 

lea's list t=·:ti£ ~:S°§ 
- Uao tblrd of ander-

B011a14 ~ Rotldll:t; ~ In scboluUtr 

~la~ ...... =~r tbe l~ 

Seaman. & Jisemann In 
INSURANCE 
SINCE 1889 

l<etp your mind on tht road, not on yourtroubltt, 
Do11't worry abOul bualn,11, tht famlly, or whal 
may Npj>eff tomorrow. KHP al-,! to Whtt't htp­
ptl\ll\G now. Good drMng't t full-ttmt job ,.. 
quiting an tltrt mind and body, If yo11 IIW9t w0ff'f, 

e, . . 
~ lie It Ill ,wr ltlture Umt. .,, 

WHEN. YOU DRIVE I I I 

Think wlH •• , think cagey , , , think eanful, , 
cauttout, chttrlu~ courteout driving, Good 
drh-lng It tht rHpontlblllty of ... ,., motontt. A 
clleerlul tldludt lowttd o4M<S on tht road will 
1• ,ou to your dutlnatlon mo,. rtlutd than H 
,OU find l•uh wtlll • ..,., dll- alOllg the way. ' 
Tlllnk careful driving whtll you'tt behind lht 
whffl. And, whon rou think of protocUon-1g1ln1t 
lht hu1rdt of olho, not•to-<:trtlul d~•trt, think 
of Sitto f arm, lht careM ij rivor't l11turanct 
company, 

TONY YANNOTTI 
H WIST OUI COI.IHllf IIOAI>, HIWVIUI. 11.' f, 

STAT£ FARM AGOO WE 1 - 3947 

~TATE FARM MUT.t,JAL 
A\JTOMOBILE INSURANCE COMPANY 
HOM E OfFICE • BLOOMINGTON, IU.INOIS 

ltAU t~•-
A 

IHIUUN< ~ I 

._ _________________ r,_,_•_•7 ___ . , . 
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11 Senice 
EDWAni> P. BOJ.Gr:u. 

airman, USN, son"""oC Mr. 
and Mr11. r:dward P. no1-
gcr of 201 J.cc ave., 
H1ck11vlllc, recently re­
ported for duty at the Nav­
al Slatlon, Argcntla, lo­
cated on tho Soulbcaet 
Coaat of the Canadian ls­
land provlnc..-c or Ncw­
!oundhmd. 

Argentla l11 of strategic 
lmportanoe a11 a ba11e far 
out Into theAtlantlcwhlQb 
iwnlc..-ets neet unlt11. 
ln addition, patrol and 

radlr · harrier · alrcndt 
operate from the ha11c, 
mnlotalninK cu n titan t 
wutch of the North Al-
lltnUC. · • 

EOWAltD A. GltA Y , 
fireman, USN, 1100 of Mr. 
und Mr11. Jamt:111 F.. Orlly, 
of 33 Spray lane, Ulcke­
vlllc, roccnUy returned 
from a Hix-week mld11hlp• 
mcn training cruise a­
bourd tho utt11ck aircraft 
curler USS Shangrt-1.a 
In the North Atlantic oil 
Newfoundland and down 
the ~'l. J.uwrcni:c Scllway 
to <,zuubcc, Canada. 

Ootilgnud to pruparc 
mldllhlpmon for their fut­
ure- rulu11 as Navy o({lc­
cri;, tho crulim pr0Ylde11 
pruLilcal training undex­
pcrlunco In shjpbotlrdop­
crntlone at Kea. 

Tho Shangri-La han At­
J11nt10 Flout unit opc:rallng 
out of Muyport, Fla. 

1 Armv Sl>E"cialh.t !'our. 

MICIIAJ-:I. !'iHAUGHNF.S­
SY, 21 and PFC THOMAS 
KOElll.Ell. 18, o[ l,evlt­
~own, 11.rc v1t11lclpat\n1'ln 
F.xcrc111u swm Slru«, JlJ. 
u u.s. Strike command 
cxcrc1,;c In Goorgiu and 
North nm.I Soulh Cnrollna, 
Involving mcfro l h a'n 
7!.,000 armed fc,rcct. pur­
l!onnul. 

Swift Strike Ill pit11 lwo 
t111;k forces ugv.lm1t ~•ch 

·othttr In a four-week mock 
war ending AURU1>t , 16, 
and lnclu<loti airborne 
n111neuvcrl4, lontt-<ilffl­
nnc • 11lrllft11, 1&lr•grou11d 
:;upport 111IHf!loni; ll n ti 
•ounforKu rrllla opera -

llOntf. 

Tlio men are r81tlllarly 
u1,11lgnt:d to the 101 st 
Alrhorno l>lvlt1lon Ill }''ort 
cumpholl, Ky. 

-PTA Country 
folk Festival . · 

The Pllr.cni- Tcacheri; 
At1Bocillt!On of tho MI d 
Island Hebrew uayScbOC>I 
ts _preseQUng a "cowitry 
PoUt Festival" and Splash 
Party onSaturdayev~nlng 
August 2-tth, 10 p.m. Ill 
the Rchool-12 Locust Ave •• 
Bcthpage. 
A deUclous Southern 

l•"Mod Chicken dlnncrwlll 
be i;eryed. Music will lie 
provided by Ille Ace Trio. 

A i;quarc danue caller 
wlll !Je on hnnd. 

lltllpaga Public Relatiaas 
• ntl liqior Man Named . 

• Stanley Pakula nas ooen . Stora . JllUDC..td chief public rcla-
!28 B<ooclway, hthpoQ• . lions consultantandpre1>1J 

cn..po111e A a. P) rcprcscntallvc for the 
__ ,, Oyster nay Town I>cmo-

Uc. L-1812 cratlc Organtu.Uon, Ed-
Wi 1.o610 'Ward J. Morris. Town 

l & W RODEN,.l'roprltlorw Leader. announced today. 
Pllltuln, a former rc­

port'er with tho Long Is­
land Dally Press unUl 
early thl11 year and 11ow 

FER3FE? 

on the 11taff of a New York. 

1llE ~UO.ISLAND TIMES 

1at1onH acpartmcnt. , Wlll 
hundlc the publicity for 
J}CJnocratt<; Town SUper­
vi,wr . ,candidate Mldutcl 
ij. pemo and other town 
candltll\tce and act Ile lla:­
tson between them und 
tl\o pfcHs, said Morris. 
"We are Indeed fprtu­

nnle ln obtiJlnlng pakula• s 
i;crvlccs" said Morris. 
"While with the Press for 
thre.c yearts, ht cu,vttrc..-d 
Oy~r Jllly Town, Is well 
11cq"'nlted with town a{­
ralrs a.nil should ix, an In.,. 
valuable aid In helping us 
got our message across 
to ttic ro,jldc.nt~." 

J>akµla s · a graduate of 
New·-York \Jnl'{crslty und 
h11s been u.ncwspapcrmun 
for six ycuri;. A' r'<fildcnt 
o( L<>11g Isl and since J 957 
he hu,; been a fiJu(fllr on 
HCV ·r.111 Kew l::t1gl11ml nml 
J.011g Ji;lanji n1.:.wH1inpcn1. 

,811'0D8 
l11pport 

'City university publlcrc- :...---------..: 

Wb.. ,om eu or home II 
wiaa,,d. your bl.peadct 
lmwtnoeageothelpl )'OU wflh 
all tho dotaJl, •• • 1«1 to It you 
Jot paid promptly, fairly. A. 

=~:~t: ~ag*cnls, WO CIII 

kind of snp- ,,. 
port. C Ill 111 'i} 
any limo; ~ ••• • 

THE THERRELL AGENCY 
36' 10. OYSTU MT ROAi> 

HIC:UVIUl. LI. H. T. 
Op,,..ltt Plot••'- SlloPt>l,,9 Ctnl,t 

WIii, 1-77" 

YOUR 
HIAUS1 

.FOltHSHOU 
~11 AIOADWAY,.HICKSV.IUI . . 

PAGB} 

-·f.EdAL?foY1~~- - folk counues •• on Ute ono 
"SU1UF.CT:-C'A'SF."'2211Pf'":: hand. and, <>ll lbe other. 
Al>Jlllcatloo of Walter day ~ opaptcd by 
Marksohn •nd Edi lb tho following organl1.a.-1 
Marksohn for a -permit tlons: , ' 
to operate us a contract Monaco SOrf Club 
carrier or passcn~rs by Camp Hill . 
motor vehicle. ciw.me Anret . ' 
AppUcatlon for ExtCIUllOB WoocJbu:ry C(7tllltry <.:lull 
lNTimn,1 ADTTlOIUTY. Capri Bcuch Club 

• •- 11.cbrcw Academy of t..ong 
ny appllcatlcm filed.June ' BeG.cll 

a, 1903, apgUcants named Tbc ' na:,bcrry .... Club of 
ta the tUle 1recJt an ex- Glen Cove - · • 
tcn~oo of authority -to . P.111t tJ761-:-'-.'r:Aag. 16 / 
transport cblldrcn ,be- SA f63QP,: 1 T"'l\ug. 16 
tween tbotr homes _ In HN ~91-l'l'•Aug. 15 
~. Nassau and SU!..- .-_r ,,... 

m,ni/fe4~From#Si 

Thom_!lllalt~n l 
,o HEWBl.lt>GI! IJQAD • ~ N. ~ i 

.,_.,.. .... ., • -l~ i 
,-.or.a,-...., r.-,.., ..... 

........ ~ ..... l\odel'Wll•PIQtlll'IIII 

GRECO BROS. 

HATES TeARS ! 

... lets you pay the_ easy wayt 
Our [Hy r,ymtftl Pl1'I slltts ll!lf 
-llllll from raid-winier bills , • , 
1ddJ I lllUe to Sprlnz and hll bllls .. ; 
.,d allows you to p,y tlwt "" you'11 
flld-ln 11au1&1, eqv-1 IIIIOIJnls. • 
Aaok wmplt of lilobllbut Aut. 
Ntlo Pmonal C.rt - Ult C011111lolt 
M11M bt1tln1 mvl'4, c,11 UI 104171 

GRECO BROS. FUEL CORP. 
Uf IIOADW(,Y IITHJIAOI, L, L • WI I.S200 

·•• 1·::u::-ow: =~ 

. ! 
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Thinlci•i It Over. 
by Robe,t L Morgon 

The Hlcksvllle School system's language depart­
ment was gtven a 1:1peclal buildup fn . the county 
press this week. So often people 1.n tho district, 
who are close to the situation , lose slstht of the . 
fact that Hlcf<svlllo has developed a good1anguage · 
djlpartment that begins In the elementary grades 
rlstht through high school. 
Tnls Is an Important development for the students 

In Hlcksvme school's that cannot be found In other 
local school districts. 

There are some lessons to be taken· from thls 
development. Ono Is tha we should appreolate the 
-tact that In spite ol any short comings that can 
be pointed out In the school dlstrlct, ana there are 
many, tho school system Is above average. A second 
Important 1 11son Is that class sl1;es unless they are 
extremely .out or proportion, are not the main criteria 
of a gooc1 school system. There arc many districts 

· bordering Hicksville that have made a fettlsh of 
class sizes and ar s pending far more per Pl!Pll 
than In Hlcksvme. Yet they . have not developed 
some of the outstlllld'lng programs available In Hicks­
ville and the porcenta~ • of Regents SCholarshlp 
\Winners Is much lower. -
.,It ls Important to emphasize the latte r fact when 
-groups with · only hypothellcal theorleiJ fight for 
more school building. This building will run up 
'the cos t of educating children nnd could possibly 
deter monE!y from the, r eal business of education. 

Neuralgia ,Muscula;: 
Pain Affects Breast · ·· 
Ry. C. A. Dean, M.O. 

(<-8 "Recently I have be.en troubled wit!\ an ache 
below my loft breas t. At times It Is acute and (eels 
sore. ,Alim my left Hhoulder and arm ache. Is this 
a muiicl · 8pasm'l'' Mrs. C. R. 

(A) Pain below the left breast, l( It Is deep, could 
be due to gas ln the colon or stoma.ch, or to a 
nuurall{la. A muscular pain Is also a 200d pos­

. Hlblllty. There is no direct oonnectton befween this 
, arP.a und the l'lhoulde r unless the pain tR under the 
hreal'!t . The muscle (pectorall.8) In thlR location 
docs go to the Rhoulder. • 

(Q) "I am to havo u P.ll.l. test. What does this 
•mean?" A.M •• S. 

(A) P.R.l. means "protein bound" lodlne." tt re- 1 
fera to the amount of Iodine and Its relationship 
to the thryolct gland. A high reading means an over-
actlvo gland. · ' • 
· Medltorlal: Rxternal otltlR or axternal ear Infec­
tion Is more prev.alent during the hot summer month.a. 
ThlH Is partly due to the. fllct that our ears are 
more moi st during thJs time, both from sweating 
and swimming. , 

Thlx type or tnle:: tlnn Involves only the ear canal. 
The ea r drum or middle ear hs not always aUect­
od, though It may t,e. The lnfeoUon Is caused gen­
erally hy hacterta nnd rarely hy a fungus . Moist­
ure In th1, ear canals s oftens the ek!u and makes 
a good growth medium for the germs. • 
·Treatment of this type of lmectloo can ~ if­
Ctcult at times. use of various antlblotlcs, eittemal 
fleat, c leaning of debris 1n the ear aud ear drops 
are helpful. •. 

Kpeplng the ear e;&nll dry hi Important In the 
prevention , of ~Is disease. If the canal geto 1!et1 
prompt drying ls nece11sary. Patlenta wllo nave ll&C1 
attacks of otms are 1Jusceptlble to repeated spells. 
The use of drop.a · aftar swlmmlJlg to dry the ears 
belps to prever.t recurrent lnfectlon11. 

I 
YOU CAN ADVERTISE IN AU '1Vf LITf,fORI 
HEWSP~PERS - .CAI.L WELLS 1-0012 fOR- IN• 
FORMATION. THE LARGEST GROUP OF NEWS• 
PAPERS ON tONO ISLAND PUBLISHED IN lfS 
O~N PLfWT. .. 
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Contiliating The ·(0■1111ists 
By Russell Kirit · • 

. The Representatives' or Uleee United Slatell nave been to Mo11oow io 
talk w~th the Soviet ,masters about atomic disarmament. It eoema 
highly Improbable, that the Communl.11t11 have made more oonoesatona 
In their capital -- feeling that they have ~mpelled ua to negottaw bl 
their own parlor - than they did at Geneva. \ 
Your servant repeatedly Is los l.n wonder at the [ancl!ul hopes of 

genUumen · who seem to think that the Sovtet leaden ~ly desire p,aoe 
throu(th compromise lllld mulWMteral disarmament, When the naJyedem­
ocratfo powers trlt!<l -- cataatrophlcally - that approach to the :.-.::. 
Jt became knowna11"appe11.semunt." ttdldnotwork wlth HIUer, and 
work with Khrushchev. 

Yet s~ch' "liberal" hopes spring eternal. Uecently a college student 
asked me, after a 11:'ctor • or mlno on foreign policy, "bat.can the SOYtet 
Russians really be so bad? After all, they've been lndoctr1n.ated only alnoe 
1918. They still have a Christian backi,'I'OUlld." 
"True, J replied." And mo11t uf the Nazi hwderscamefrom good Chrlst­

lan homes, and bad be •n Indoctrinated only five or ten years. And well­
meaning gentlumen llku Neville Ch11.mberlaln decided that Goering and 
his friends weren't rctllly wicked, because they liked fleld-sp0rta and 
l:lpproclRted ltO<>d plcturet1. Could the Nazis really do horrid things, wttb 
their Chrl Rtfan backgrounds? WeJI, yes, they coUld - and they did." 

F9r an uc1.,-urate r ev' cw of Soviet diplomacy, I commended to my readers 
11. new t,ook hy Ur. Ant:nny aou · C11ren, "Soviet Foreign Polley: a Pattern 
of Pl! h1tence." As Prr-tessor BouKcuron makes clear. Communist dip­
lomacy huH been succt·Js!ul, mos t of the tlm •·. Some forty-five years 
ugo, th • Dolshcvtk11 r,o tSses~d nothing but a room ln Zurich. "'today 
they control onc-U1Inl of the world's population and · pne-fourth of the 
land area of the world." 

Ju1.1t as It would havt! hcun po11elblc to p.redkt the Nazi for lgn policy 
If only dt1:n•.>crat1c lt!ndurs had taken the trouble to read and beU&Te 
"Mein Kumpf," so It ht not difficult tu foresee what Khruscbev and 
his aR1>oclate11 mean, tu do In tha Mo11cow nuclear- weapons conference­
If one 1)9 hor11 tn r ekd ><uch book~ ns Dr. Bou11caren•s. soviet foreign 
pulley lfl not highly · lrrUtglnatlvc•, but It • I s nothing tr not penlstent. 

Tilt! Sovlut.H du nut ,lt·slre world pt•aet-: they de11lrc world mastery, 
moru thtm did Hltlur. Talk of peace they employ only to gain time (or 
military nml diplomat IC' m11m1uv •r11. Whr.n tht• vllclllatlng Wet1t makes 
onie conoos:-lon, the ~Itel dlplomatt1, with rt1doubled arropneti, demand 
lwo or thn:.- more. After all, thlt< policy hat< bruugllt them 11uccet1808 
fur forty-five yearK. Whim, two yeari< ngo, th,· Soviets brar.cnly exploded 
a 11lxty-nlt'gaton bomb during the Gcmeva. negotlatlon11, they simply 
wen• ttctlng persl,;t1:nt1y. l)ld we have a rlgllt to expect them to bo 
radically t:l\ilngcd'I ' 1/ • 
Yul the SuvletK l\rt• nut tnvlnclblt• ogres to whom frei<h concou.tons 

mu11t be madu 1WB><onully. 1-·1r11t or all, It ltm't po881blt- to conclllatc 
01,rre11: they keep on elltlng people, no m1ttter bow politely one treat11 
them. se,:ond, the Soviets ron't lnvlhclbli:: In weapon~ and ln tho 
economy, they are far weaker ,then we are. They respect only strength: 
a rmed tttrt·ngth, end f!trongth; ln policy (even when It ls dlHplayed by so 
:<mull 1t i; alt• llt< Fln!Hnd). Rut conciliation whets their appetites. 

In Service 
Army · r)yt, llOflE111' c. 

HOHM. I !1-ycnr-old SOIi 
of Mr. 11nd Mrs. <.:hurll ·b 
J. Hohm, who li ve ot 8 
CrCRCC.:lll pl., IWlhpug(•. 
wn i; naelg11c.:tl to tht.: 22d 
Arlllll-r~• .· rl[ttlery II at 
vort J\nm!lor , c u nu! 
'l,1111 ·• Augui;t 2. 

Hohm ontor11d thu Army 
In F •liru11ry or thi s yc•11r 
1111d cumpl~ed h u s I c 
tratnlni: ot Port Dix, N. 
J . -

·• • ~u 

YOUIIIDCI09 · 
'BLOOD 
CENTER 

NEEDS DONORS 

' VHAT IS YOOR HIARINO ICOUt 
n1 YOU .. LI ____ _ 

• 
,. 0. , .. ~·· .... ~ ..... ......... .,.. ,_ .. , ............. _,, .... 
, . •• , .. _,.. .. felt .. .... 

.... ,.,.~ ............. rt., 

,. ,.,. , .... --· , ..... M4 '" 
___ .. ... 

4, W .. 11 )POV fr011•..,lfr tllie "'­
f ,V, ., ••,lie • ll"le ..... ., 

,. ,.,.,. ......... ~ ... ,...,. na 8 ... , ,... .iw.,, '""'•mew HO 
,_ ,0 ,olo!' f., -~ HO ••'"' --4, ii rtv• - I Kt•t II '- ftto• 

,,.i.,11, JO• o,e t l~JW• ,. tHol<t • Jttt T.Y~ hcff•lotl 4..ic. t""1 
~ •It t 141 ,... "' • •• ' '""' i..,,_ yw, ,.i.,. ... 11 ol T.v. ■"4 lffle 
,......... n,;, ....... " .... ...w ,., .... t.o"'4!_,._,.,. ..,,, , .... 
..... - nu ""''"' ••""•• ,.,.. di, ""' r••• '"' ,.,., n4 _. _,. 
fh ' NN '"'' "''""' /vi} w,ttt ... • 

"T,V, HEARING DIVIC*'' r 
Dept. HY' Wostiln91011. II, 0, C, 

MID ISLAND TIMES 
rubll"htd hr th• LIT.MOR l'URI.ISIII NO COII I'. 

22 W 11 ~lchul•I Street, Hldtn lllt, ~. Y~ Wt: 1·0012 
tMl9fN o, M<O"d c.'-tt MCttttt u, , ... ,ou OfUc•. Hk\,"11'-, N. • • 

1•.o. 1101 7, Uelllp•~•. N. \' , 
COMPOSITION llt:SrO, SllllLITY : 'fhls news pn11 r will Ml he llaol• 

, for ~rror appearing In nny 11dvertl1lnl' beyond <011 ur lht tJJft«' •11:~upled 
:.; by the error . 
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1;1'0c a word for s· newspapers 
I ' 
I , 

I , 

e CDITU IILA.,-o lOtWI 
e ICID-ULAllD TDDtl 
• JllrrllAoa: XlnnO&UI 
• aYOUCT .u,v.ura · 
e IUlCBO JntWWOrL'fAJ, 

Just Cal~ YOJJr Ad In To W! 1.0012 
· '3.00 MINIMUM - tOe A WORD 
D~ MOln>AY KOOK l'08 LUI& ,rm 

ttelp wani 
HowsewoI'er - Clean.tng 

and -lroninr. 9 -3, 2 
daya weekfy. $1.25 per 
hour. My-➔-5024. 
IX Aug, 2. 

· MAN OR WOM_M_ 
To 6CrYICC roiircofpoit­
.. stamp 1n1tL-hlnes. 
llaBt have min. 10 boars 
per week. CU-nece86aZy. 
$2975 CA SR INVEST-

MENT 
FUI.I,Y SEC. Good char .• 
1teat, sober. PotenUl.l 
start $5,000 yr. WJ1te a 
about yourself. (Ba& K) 
glring particulars. In­
cluding phone number.All 
replies cunfldentlal. 1 

voJfi~~~l wtti" do r,1_T_-_A_u_g_._1_s __ ....,_...,, 
any l<lnd of accounting or SALESMAN 
bookkeeping work, part- o.. ,. _ .. _... -' _ 
time , nhthts · and satur- =' .,":" ..r::::'::-..::; ... ~ 
days. Bolhpagi• • Hlckt1- ......., ., - ...... ...,_ ,u. 
vUle 11n•a pre!err1•d. w1-: ~~._ ~0;~ 
·S-7351. • - ~ .. .., t1oo 
lX - Aug. 16 =:.,-:.,'t,. ~-'"i.."'"..._ "t,~ 

RE-ROORNG -STORM DAIIME 
• Remcmabfe 
• ,,.. &tfmate 

AU won D0N1 
IT MTSD.f 

WA,:1-4198 

Gladys Gilbert 
HIGHLY SPECIALIZED 

AL TERA TIONS 
COUTURIER 

ORESSMAKINC 
TAILORING , 

1218 Stewart An. 
WI S-9659 hthpo1• 

f:'~=-~ .... ~ "-"' 
toe »POIHT .. t"T, Wlllf 10. 

'-t~...t:i""°--, 
m,...,a..1<.w.-w-1We­
-•11,~s.0.c. 

RENT A CAR 
RENTATRUCK 

AT 

Maddens 
Day, Week,· 

Month Rentals 
Loni Tenn Lea~ln1 

140 WOODBURY RD. 
HICKSVILLE 

WE 1·2505 WE M814 

Amerlan [Jl)m\ 

Credit Carda Honored 
I 

£CONOCAR AFFILIATE 

~ 
BA c · L ION E 

Plamblag & Heotfng 

• Alterotlon1 
• Se"ice & llepolr 

PES!950 $7 Stftart Ave. Bttt,pqt 

PLAINVIEW ~-
( 

WiNES tlQUORS and 
.;, "YOUR COMMUNITY STOii'' 

. :,t; 1110ld Country ltd.. ri. Emt of South Oyder lay 14 

YOU RING - WI HING , 

l PLAINVIEW, N. Y. I WI 1-4646 
li;.l'l_.;.---- ..,,..a:lll]J,'1.'ra,:W:,I ,._ •!,, · 

, ,I.•. Ji, 

flne,juiera{service ... . 
Need Not Mean High Cost! 

Your cost for a co..;plcte funeral ls dctet• 
mined primarily by 1he c:askec selected. Our 
,pacious .i.o,.·rooms display a wide ,'lll'iecy 
of dearly price-markcil c:ashu. ThuJ 1hc 
family may •k-a a coaiplrtc fun..ral ,-•ithin 
,heir 6nandal meaoL • 

'OOmouwmtr( 
, .. IINra ·-- IWllll -rs 

IN OARDIEN CITY 
Tr,nUin A,t. at 15111 St._ Plonttr 6-0666 

IN JACKaON NIUOHTa 
II0-20 Roosevelt Ave. _ lWlnfna J.2200 

IN JAMAICA 
150-10 lflllslde Alt._ JAJNlu 6-667~ 

INSURE • .. 
YOUR 
HOME 
wn'HA -1. 

'BLANKET OF PROTECTIOW 

Instead of-ciostly ''patcluw' of fnluraDce ••• 1lre, 
c!amaae'to contentl, theft and llabnity, enJo7 a 
"blanket of protection" ••• a Merchantl Mutual 
Homeownen Package Polley. Th.Lt Homeownera 
policy provfdel all neceeaar, coverages at a COit 
of up to30% lm tlian you may now be paying for 
"patchwork" oovera,-. \, m 
Call tocJa:, and Jet III ahow yau the 
advantagei of Merclwita Mutual 
Jlomeo,rnen Imurmce. • 

J'OSEP1H DOCKOW 
REAL fST ATE and INSURJ\NCE 

90 BROADWAY WE 1-2460 HICKSVILLI 

HEi p° '!1/'Xl'lThD.·- :: : 
Hous •work~r - own car. 

' Cltmnlng ttnd Ironing. c,nc· 
long or two i;horl d1ty~ 
weeldy. Sl.25 per hoor. 
WA 1-:142:t morni ng or 
•·v~nlng!'<. 
:1x - Au~: l Ii , 2:t, :10 

~EI,PWANTED 
creailon worker. E.x­

perlence.d lo supervls 
actlvltlee of :senfor cit­
izens. Five day • . week. 
Permanent, good · sale,ry, 
fringe benefits. MY 2-
7070- or write to A. i-: 1 Copeland, n d-r r w o o < ✓ 
Homo for Blind, Cold 
Spring Harbor, N. Y. 
2X- /.U2, 9, '16 

REPLACll 
your okl f•sliloned' 

float and rod 
~n cock 'with 

rnod¥n 

~ENTO~V. ~2_lS 
, · BETHPAGE 

TOOL & HARDWARE CO. 
Ph,1mbl~i & Et«tr.CAt Su1>9llff 

P•lnts - VeneitJan 8Und,. .. Sha<S,et, 
Keys & lo<lls • Conlon SUl)Plles 
• ~ BIIOADW~Y, (Opp. 11•1\1() 

Bethpai;o, N.., Yor~ 
WEIii MUI 

MODERN MASONRY 
l>isli.-liu /Jritk ll'or• 
Concrete :111J S1,1nc • 
Cusrom l>ciign ing 

l'IISE fallNATP. 
t,. Dclu.cia MY· l-8203 

NEWSP APF.I\ ADS Ml 
• SO EAS1 TO ORD€!\. 

I 
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NOTlCE TOJ,!DDE&'l BY ORDER OF THETOWN 
,. PLEASE TAKE NOTICR BOARD OF THE TC7NN 

CHASING 
THOMAS R. PYNCHON 
SUPERVISOR 'l'laere'a no llmlt to the · A halo can aet to be 

bold thfngs people would CNlte a nutsanoe ll you 
do--sr they we~ ~ you.-- Jiaye to explaln tt,--Parta that SEALEDPROPOOALS irL?i~ERB BA & KEEFE 

must " be received and TOWN CLERK 
stamped by th!! Director CHARLES F. mcKS 
of P11rcha111ng of the Town DIR ECTOR 01.- PUR 

Dated: Oyster Bay, New 
York 
August 13 1963 
BNtl692-fT-Aug. 15 

Jrfah Digest Pupa 

of Oyster Bay, at his . 
otffce l09&ted at No. 10 1-----------------------------.----------------Aadrey Ave., Oyster Bay, 
New York, not later than 
11:00 a.m. prevaJUngtfme • 
oa Augw,t 28, 1963 fol­
lowing whlcb time they 
wlll be publicly C>p1!necl 
and read and the contract 
awardedassoonthoreafter 
as practicable 'for: PUr­
ohase of New P.aTts for 
,p Ci H .crancs·ISerlal I 
16239 and 16240; Rbots­
connersvlll e Blower Type 
AF Sl,;e 65 Serial 15622-

•• 35 and Lima crane sor-
1Al 13389-16 Type 44 for 
·1nolnerator Town of Oy­
ster Bay, New York Un­

,der Bld Proposal M&S 
ffl-63 · 
SPeclflcatlon s for theil 

abbYe together with bl 
forms may be seen, ex­
amllled and obtained at 
She o!!loe of the Director 
of Purohas1n1; No. 10 Au­
drey Ave., oyster Bay, 
New Yor.k on and after 
August 16, 1963 durlng , 
remtWar business hours. 
1'be TOwn Board ro -

senes the rlldit to r e­
Jeot any or all bids In 
wbolo or In pa)'t, to 
waive· any Informality In 
any or all bids and to 
aooept tho bid or part 
thereof which It deems 
most favorable to the 
Town alter all bids have 
been examined and ch'eQk­
ed. ,No bid s hall be with­
drawn for a period of 
45 days after. being puh-

• Holy opened and read • 
RETURN TWO (2) PRO­
POSA LS ORJGl~AL AND 
ONE (I) buPLICATE OR­
IGINAL . In the event bids 
•re r oJccted, or no bids 
are r eceived, tho Town . 
Clerk Is authori zed · to 
r~verttse for bids upon ~ 
dlroctlo n o ! t h e Sup­
erv lsor . 

Girt.a & ·Greetings 
for You ...,. through 

WEL~ OME WAGON 
,;om }"oar Fri endly • 

• l1u1ir1eu Nci'1,bon, 
• , end Civio,, end 
Social }Vellare Le,dar• 

WA z:6819 

,,. 

9 
important 
reasons. 
whv a First 
National City 
mortgage 
can save 
you mo~ 

Our flnance-ln-advaac:e 
plan can auure you a 

mort&a1e&fore you p 
house huntfn1, sabJect 
only to final appraisal. 

No penalty 
for prepayment of 

your ll10f'tla1• 
after one y11r. 

low 
dosht1 
costs. 

Futappralql 
service 

wttllin 41 hours 
orless. 

First National City . 
II the klftd of bank that 

can provide the extra ~ney so 
· oftu needed at house-1Maytn1 

time. Low-cost loans for new 
appliances, movlnr, fumlblre, 

decoratfn1, etc. 

Slop by and see a First National City mortgage specialist today. He'll glve you all the advice you 
need on mortgages. Show you how a First National City mortga'ge can save you money. Show 
you how you can raise extra money by refinancing your present mortgage. Arrange an FHA 
mortgage if you wish. You'll find a mortgage speclallst In all of our more than 100 branches 
In New York Ci '/, Nassau, Westchester. Early hours for commuters in inany branches. 

. FIRST NATIONAL CITY 
... THE ONLY BANK YOUR FAMILY EVIA Nl!EDS 

Dill 559-3333 to ae. , 
mortgage appllc.,tfoo d 
and to get fu ll details . 
time, day or night, even week-

'""'"'.'" .. , .. ,,.,,. • •• ~ .. 1"9tlt .............. , . ... _... . , ... 

ON LONG ISLAND: FREEPORT '1 80 West Merrick Rd.• HEWLETT 1316 Broadway • JERICHO 80 Jericho Tpko • LEVIT• 
TOWN 294042 Hempstoa'd Tpke. • MASSAPEQUA PARK 4881 Merrick Rd. • NEW HYDE PARK Union Tpke.•lakevlllo 
Rd. • PLAINVIEW 1125 Old Country Rd. • PORT WASHINGTON 923 Port Washington Blvd. • SYOSSET 190 Jericho Tpke. 
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Thon there was the 
woman who married !ou.r 
men: A l'lob man. an 
actor. • minister, and last 
a mortician. Seems she 
had once beard that one 
!or the moooy, two !or tho 
show, made three to .make 
ready and !our to go.-­
Fuel Oil News 

Little by Uttle. fhe problem of what to do with 
about, !or, and to teen-agers Is being solved. A 
mother or three teenage datmbters makes the last 
drl who retu.Ts home Satur<lny night prepare Sun­
ilay. breaJc!ar! for all the family.-- Cryetnl Springs 
(Mies.) Mc~or 

I 

In_ mlddle ago uour Tripping ls ·tess Tight bu~ more 
!antastlc.--MedlnR (Ohio) Leader-Poet 

~ -
' .: All ·of My Paint 
->~) · De~lers are Trained 

~ PAIN, ~IAIJ8T-S· 
LET TijEM HELP WITH YOU_R PAIHTl ~ G AHD DECORATING HEEDS! 
" MY ,,.,NT $P[CIAU$TS CAM TILL YOU THI a1GHT ,AIMT TO U$1 ,ca THI JOI YOU 
HAVI IN Ml~D. ,Lus, IACH sn, TO TAKI ,ca ,ao,us10MAL-LIKI ltSULTSI THEY 
AU ,u,AllD TO ADVISE YOU OH AMY PAIHTIHG oa DICOlATIHG l'ttOIUM 
THAT IS TlOUILISOMl. I IHVITI YOU TO MAKI USI OF THIS SllVICI •• • TODAY!"' 

>.»HALT 

1-i;:ai;;t::;•,r ALUMINUM 

~ SS" 

IHTEllOl LATEX 
WA~L PAINT 

• JXCILLhn' HIDIHG 
AHD COVOAGI 

• DalU IH JO MIHUTIS 
• WASHAILI 
• HO ,AIHTY ODOl 
• WY TO Al'H.Y WITH 

HUSK Ol lOUll 
• FOa IHTlllOa USI OH 

WAW, CIIUHGS,PLASTil, 
WALLIOAaD, ffC. 

• SOAI' AHD WATil 
CLIAH,UP 

---- ' ' HOUSI PAIHT ' 

,: SS" i.·,• 'S6" S==- V · , 
~~ ,_ OAL Pit GA.I. ~ "\ ,_GAL 

--'""' MITWOM.fRE£ " 

' ALKYD fLAT 'OUTSIDE WHITI 

--=:::-- MIY w ~ FRE£ .. Ml"\' , ... GAL FREI 

on all MaJui c• Brand Paint lOOF & 
IAltM UD 
$4" ::r :::FREI: 

tJALLOilS ONLY · .r " 0 m:•• <OU 
II 111111 

SALE-WALl TILES 21/2c 
LARGE SELECTION OF BEAUTIFUL COLORS • 

MA.RY CARTER DISCOUNT MART 
Paints -i- Wallpaper •l• TIies 

Custom Window Shades 
184 l'way Hlcbvllle, N. Y. OV 1-1175 

Pf.GE 1 

TENPIN TIPS Plpelln•. of .LHe 
IJ F1tAN1l cuvu 

.. KMpfng Hand Dry 
Most m•m bowUnt etntti, 

have eutomatlo band CIIYtn or 
) 'OU ~ min or talcum powd# t 
or varltly ot othu aid&. '!1,a, 
may htlp: Jult btfort I lns<,rt 
llni:trt In ball. I cup m, hanol 
and tap II •rtJnat my lhoulcw, 
or l•i:. It'• • method thll work• 
for mt. 

(! 

I CAN SAVE r. 48% 
WITH Oil HEAT 

'-
{~ 

( THAT'S USING YOUR H AD) 

LET 

TAKE YOU 

BACK TO SCHOOL! 
SHIRTS 

LONG SLEEVE l Sport 
SHORT SLEEVE } or from 

Dress 

PANTS 
CONTINENTAL & IVY STYLES from , $3.50 

'SHOES 
rNJ~~t}L 1N~0~:=~~tE8. v8:fA~~­

fr~m $4.98 
EVERYTHING FOR MEN AND SOYS 
192 BROADWAY; HICKSVILLE 

(neor Old Country Rood) 

. WEiis 1-0441 . 
OPEN EVERY EVENING 'Tll 9 P.M. q:,-cept Sot.) 

- FREE PARKING AT REAR OF 'srORE -

.. 

/ ] 
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JT lB TO 8£ tx~ lllat Mlmlnn Cit ::;unllWala 
I (or ptrbopa Mtl•Art/ \1'111 prorc.a to undentand 
tbb drawtns abOff, 

"What a atrlklnl Uktncu!" they may oxd4!m. 
~ae. l10W bt w&Jb w1lh hl.t oyo alway, on u,. 
SZ")Wld, Illa htad full of . Ulualona and elementary 
malhematlcal Mant,oual U Y.'t m t Ill/II In llw 
et.Zttt we llhould•know him ln,rtanlly.~ 

The 1,roblem for 111• of'dfnary ru dtr, howe,·er, 
la not to rtcognfu tbt artlat but to unrartl hla 
lllualona. ,. 

ID prfffflllnl Ulla clnn ettt,tlon In \laua aa4 
La1>,rt1nth11 A Book or Puulu lpub. 1>1 Oovor1, 
W11l t c r S hepherd 1llpul11tca l hn l lfi4 YlewlT la on 
hl.t tionor lo do tho untangllnl t,y •Y• only, unaided 
~Y pcncu or other polnler. 

. Pick up lbe Ulrcad nt the arrow marked ;•o," Md 
follow It U1rough oU lbe olJatacl a 1111 you t r rh•o 
01 0110 or CJ• numbe rs along tho top or the p icture. 

THEY~E IN THE BAG 
c:1uarmT PIIILLIPS Include~ I.ht rono"1ng l.n hll 
~ coll lion, ~•1 lleot l'~ll• In lhgio and lltll• 
,ontnr (p~b. by Dover), lhot la, pour• which do• 
mond ,no ma UlemaUcnl Jmowledgt, but c111l for clea.r 
thinking and an ability to utAbllah the Jog-lcaJ rt• 
lat10111hlfl# whlcb the data pruented Imply : 

A bog oontalna twenty marblu. They are of 
three dl!Jertnt color,. There are 1lsbt blue,, onu, 
uvm red onu, and tlvo men onu. You re Ill• 
,1te<1 to ~loso your eye, lllJd draw tho mulmum 
lfumber of m11rblu con1l11.fflt with JOl)r leaving In 
tho bag : U I at te111t Cour marble, of any color, 
llM, 12) at leut three m11rblu or any uconcl color, 

116w many marble, lhoulJ you mw:r 
· • WJ~~an~ nw "'-•~ •.,u .a.a.oq •a, r•P 0.1, 'fJ~o• ' J•lflO ••u 10 O&t 'J"o ,pu• 't♦tU> :.::1j 

F :1", 11~~·'J,.i;:19~u ~C'fl~ •;1,f ..ft;d -q~f!°!uo111~ 
ao> ~ 111Nlli• • ~1 'OtJQn 111 IQ~J• • "'P ooA II A1111<11• 

/ CllU , , prrvo> OJ f .H\I noJ.., IMJ1111114 .,H l4 ,., ••• , 

Tl!J!' !'IUD-ISLAND TIMES 

E 

., .. 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 

l &ercire the Muscles of t!Je Mind 011 These l 
SUPPOSE tbat C1C1 the clay "-- 87 CLARK KISSAIIID 

fore Y•terday, the weatbu BENJAMIN FRANKLIN, Caliloo. Lord Byron, 
forecuter broaclcaat, "Today'• Edgar Alllln Poe, Coori;o 011Ma11 r1er, Oeorr• 
weatbtt ta dlttemtt rrom yuta- 011111, c. t. Oodpon ( .. L<,wl• cnrroll" I, Frandl 
d&y'L u the wu.ther la the l&lllO Bo.oon, AUC'U't ' l(oblu.a, L<onord •-:.11cr Md Lord 
tomonow u U wu yuurday, Macaulay are amooi lhe ootablCII In llteratUN and 
the day alter tomorrow will ban IIC!enc, wbo hare dellchttd In com po,u,, and IOlv• 
the eo.mt weatlltr u the clay be- ~ puules. 

• tore Jesta'day. But U tlla tre«tb• Tbey would base agrttel ,<1 th A. I~ ~uld. t.he 
e. la lhe aame tomorrow, u 11 ll Englbh poet Md AUthor, tbot -►-,n~ l n,; out pun.Jes 
tod11y, tho day alter tomorrow la the aamo kl.nd or e.~•rclae for the mind u n1n• 
will ba\'o Ille aame weather u nlng, leaping Md \\~Uni; an, for the bOdy. Jull 
yeattrday." u the latter prepare tht body Md llll\kc It alert 

Lct'1 .,.u01e It 11 ralnlna t.o- and actl\'e tor anythlni; It nu,y be Cll ll c<I upol\ to 
d iiy, Md It .rained the ®)' ~ perform. 10 doe1 the fin ding out ol Good puuJ .. 
fore yutcrda:,. Alao that tho rl"• qulckneu ot though.I. and tacllily tor tumlni 
rorecater'1 pndlctkm pro,'td cor• a problem e,~ ry 11,ay, and ,·1,w1n, ll In ~,n-y ~ ­
rect. Wb&t WU the IO<Hthtr IUro llble llabt.. 
yutcrday 1 Alona with M expanding public 1111 ru t I.Oday In 

' (lfttnd O<ll "11 IIClmlc-t,-puulea and "bntln lt.utra" b;I cd on ID&the-
,..,, ,._ >"11•• OCU. •••i••to11 r malice. phy~ln or torlc tulve I · : come to eoJoy ~••tr popululty It's in the Cards than IV r. Slpl!l~Uy, the 

fldentl!Jc Ameri~an ~lttp.wit lllU SA)£ LOYD, WIIO \\,U to Dtcome ODO of th• Im• a nrular monthly dC'p&rtrnfflt 
mortal namu of puuledom, attncted attenuon devoted to puulu. Compllltlmul 

"ith bla problema bUtd on WIii.it and IIMI tMn at JTUI pot<TI ot the paat IU"e 

nonl pmo of auction brldre. lnd~ It nu ~ In dtnsalld, and tho ~ ot 
cWmed that Loyd'• brlda• plLZZlH dld mucll to Sam Loyd. R. E. OUdfflty, HU• 
popularlu Ille same In tho United Btata, Into wllteh bert Pllllllpa (''Caliban"), Omald 
It wu Introduced from t:a1Jand In th~ 18110e. lt Kaulnlan, Juomo Mf'Jfl', M. 
\I'll retaU\'ely little known In UM UDlltd lll&tu Kraltebllr Md other rnuter­
Wlt0 ty."O d-6u law. mum ot pun1t, arc a,'&llabt• 

An Ensfl.tllman, Hubert PbUllp1, who lllff the apln tn lntxpenalve papati&w. 
patUdooym Of "Calaban," ll • D>Odml compoaltor NOle1l'Ol1by n.,,, eoll~IQc\o .... 
ot lntrlpllls contra.et bridge b~-tluua. Tba com!JIC out 1n l>lU'dco,•u edltlona. 
tollow1IIC ta rrom Cal1bd'a 1'T'OWca lloolli w.u- A tt&CStr wi- mtnat nae 
malkal. rarneaflal u4 c~ hl:UN (pull, Wto ltlmu1aLo4 by ex&111ple8 

by DoYer). sf\'eti In thla pqt C&ll ~ lllm-
ln a hand dealt at contmcl brldJt, lbe btddlnS ee'lf or !Mnelt acquahltad wlUl 

, rrnt u fo!low,: tl\l hit In old and oew puai.-

s 
doubk 2. 

C ,.3 • •;J No Bid 
S '♦ No Bid 
6 No Trump No Bid 

N 

~: 6. 
7 NoTrvmp. 

\ 

llom lhl'oup Ult N~t boolta u.t.. 
.ii below, 

Allpw. · 
i Wut kd tht. ,. Nonh playtd the • '· and~ lbc •• s. 
~ Nonh played 11M rolknrina cards co the rcmalntnr 1mb, In lht 
order alvcn: 

The Canterbury Puulu and 
A!IIURrllfflla 1ft MaUlaoatlea, 
both by H. E. Dudtll4IJ ( Do-rer: 
11.25 ncll) •• , l"lm and Oarnn. 
by A.Jeund,r Van ~r 
(Creat: Uc) •••• M.__ and 
Labyrlntlla, by W1li1r 8llepMrd 
(DoYor: Ill, •.• ~al.bcm&Uca 
tn Everyday 11,lnr•. by w. c. 
Vtrpra (Blpet: 7~) •••• Mqlo 
llq~ and Cull-. by W. 8. All• 
drew, (Dover: U 5) •• •• My 
~•t Pu.atu In Loctc and ftta. 
IOlllng. by Hu b tr t PhllUPI 
.(Dover: •11. , •• n. Mod- M­
peot ot Malhemat.Jc,, by Lucleont 
Felix (Science >::clltlona: St.Sil). 
, • • Of If en and Numbml, by 
J1llll Muir (Dell: 60c). 

Trick 2 • • ♦ J Trick I • ♦ K 
3 • • :1 ,. 9 • • ♦ A 

" 4 • • 9 ., ·to • • • A 
: S • • ♦ J . ,. ll • • ♦ ♦ I~ 

7 • ♦ Q ,, 13. • ♦ K 
0 6 • • ♦ K J)," 12 • • 

To 1;c 13th trklt, E&st played 1 ♦ 7, Sou1h took all 1hlrtcc11 ' 
tricks in his own hUld. Rlddlt •De• Ott, by Bennett 

Cerf (Rudom HO\IM: fl.86), 

Nu;nberology 
FIOIJRE.I cu be tricky, ot 

count. Her, ar, 10m1 .um• 
plea: 

1-Wrlll four ntnu ao tJJ-,, 
wUJ tQUal 100. 

2-Mak• a - -,111u11s ot 
thjl nl\lru 1, to t IO that lha 
vertical column ao4 the borl~• 
I.al Un• will llotll total 1.111 •m• 
amount. • 

8-Wrlll 1111 evar llumbtr, 
UJ~S only od4 dlsfll. 

4--11:xprtN 2' Wit.It UiNe fllllal 
flsu,e, ot.ba- tball I. 

-n ■Tffillt C tnJd .-,JRcl • 
U l/1 r-. -,!Alt 'l"'SUU I 
•1•1•os1••n 'l 'Cit w-1 11• 

Thi , quuUoa 1,, what wer1 wlth mor1 th&D (50 conundrumt. 
South·• thlrutn card.a? How , • • rn,·lt&U09 lCI l(lthematlca, 
qulclcly ear. JOU dtduc. the all• by Wm. Oleoo 6 Donovan A. 
1wer, JollMon (Doubleday: I l, with 

• 1 -:'1 'VH•~~~~ ,:,~\1 ~~ 10m1 600 puulu and ctl\'o 
~1 f,,.,~ ·~ • 'Vt'! ••- probltma. •• , Tbt Ucal 
WV ':z.-'.\ if- ~"'°Ji,?~•= Mafple, by CIIIUJn an 
~1q1 1ro .. ~~nos 11 .,.,.,.. (Slmoo A Scbuatu: Ji.9111, an 

Shipping P,·oblem 
SUPPdail you woN 011 a ahlp 

bound tor a ncatlon. lt Jou wu, atandllls 011 atart>oanl 1ld• 
e.dnc tile bow, would the near,, 
eat rail be, on your rl1ht or your 
ltftT 

ttno• r11111u , .. ,..~% 'rlf .::,r 

•• '1)tert&lntns anthology Of dlv1r-
1lon1 and excunlona. • -. • Math► 
mat.Jc, for PleaaUN, by Oawald 
Jacoby, '!fllh W, R, lknaon 
(J,lcQraw•HIII: JUG), • • , TIM 
nmny Book ot J'un, by 11a1r1ty 
6 Monroe Paxman ll'Nntl0► 
Hal11 '3,9G) , •• • Wml Oam11 
for l'la,y and l'owtr, by Joteph 
T. Shipley (Prtntlce-Hall r f3.9~). 



-,j·i,s~ .: . notice tnal 
Mlllleil Pft1p0llals mull\ be 
recelled &Del stami>ed by 
tie Director of Pul'chaslng 
of the TOwn of Oyster 
11a7. at his omcc lac.led 
•t~No. 10 Audrey Ave., 
Oyilter Bay, Now York, 
llOt later thnn 11:00 n.m. 
pnrtalllng lime on Scp­
tmnbcr II, 1963 following 

which Ume til07 wllUi: 
pi,bllcly 91>ened .and read 
nnd the contract awarded­
ae soon thereafter as 
.pracllcablo for: Purchase 
of llequlremente of Sew­
age Aid and Chemicals 
£or Various Departments 
of the Town of. Oyster . 
nay under Dld Proposal 
M la S f74-63 · 
Specifications for the 

THE MIO.ISLAND TIMES 

aboYe togcChiir wltll .bid whole or Ul part. 11:1..-hie 
for11_111 may be ReD • ex- any tnformallty la ay or 
llmlncd and obtlwied at· all bids and to aci:ept 
the omoo of the Director the bld or part thereof 
or Purchasing. No. 10 · which lt deems moat !av­
Audroy Ave •• Oyster nay. orablc to tbe Town after 
NOW York OD .ud after nll blds have becJI ex­
Auguet 16. 1963 dartog amlncd and checked. No 
regular ,buslaeas boua. hid shall be wlthdl'IIWJI 

PAGE? 

BY onmm or 'tllE 
l'OWN DOAJ.U> OF THE 
TOWN OF OYSTF.ll BAT 
WlUam n. C7 Keefe 
Town Cleric _ t 
Charles 1-'. nicks • 
Dlrector of Purclwllng ' 
·rhomas n. · Pynchon ~ 
SupervJ!JOr ' · 
Dated: Oyster Bay, ·N.Y. 
August 13. 1963 
Ilf;TH fl693-1T-Aug. 15 

Too Town, BOard re - for a period of 45 days 
serves the rlRJat to re- aftcr·ootngpubllclyopencd 
Ject a~y or all bide iD and read • .Return Two (2) 

l>roposals. Orlglnlll and 
------------------------------ One (I) DupllcaleOrlglnal. 

In the event bids a-re rc-

~~ 
LONG 

ISLAND 
FAIR! 

•• j 

· ORIGINAL 
MINEqLA FAIR 

! 

AUG.24 
through · 

SEPT. 2, 
1963 

ROOSEVELT 
RACEWAY 
Westbury 

Long Island 

Booths 191-192-193 ·· 

"BElTER LIVING with GAS .& ELECTRICITY". 
PLUS • . , A PREVIEW OF THE GAS EXHIBIT AT THE 1964 N. Y. 

WORLD'S FAIR. Special film to be shown at the LILCO 
BLUE FLAME THEATER. Aperfectpl•cetositdown and rest. 

Golden Harvest of Old-Fashlone_d Country Festivltles ... Uvestock ... Produce .. . 
Old Time Ha mess Ricing for fun (no betting) ... Hootenanny Folk Singers .. . 
Complete Chicken F•rm Operation (See baby chicks hatched) . .. Modern Midway 
• . • Thrills .. • Pageantry . •• Muf h More,' · 

10 DAYS OF FUN! 

Lt4..£11 
Alt l#'lfl10ff•""'"1lA IAYAn#G t'OI/JIWl'J' 

.......:> 

J cctcd. or no bids are 
received, the Town Cler!' 
Is authorlt.etl to rc11dver- · 
Use £or ,bldH u1l0n the 
direction of the Supcrvl-
:-;or. 

Congrotulaffom to both ol you. __ 

Now we can Sita Peter Petralia of 
._ OLD COUNTRY MANOR about :.,\ 

liil Exciting Wedding Padage . : j 
J• dL ~ -ues,gne ror you. , . ·· 

2 '"V • .: 
~ 

Here's What We Offer: .. 
for $8.00 per person .._ 

MENU INCLUDES 
MANHATTAN ~ CH"-""AONf ... , Served Thrc1>Qho"1 Wo<ld, .. 

Cll,'IY I, ~UVfS Ooo lcttlo of t),o for E .. ,7 10 , .. ,_ , 
PUSH Pl!Ult COCICTAIL All Set Upo l•d.do<I 

~H~~~li; t~:fH All Soh Oriol , lo,lud,d' 
01 . W•ddl•g Colo With L'roo.:... 

IOAST TUIKFf (""7 Typo) (Aa7 fllllog) ' 
CHOICf Of PUSIJ Vf0£1AIIU Wol ..... , Oret•itr' 

Cl!~~ ru:rATO ..... Ploww Cool•r ,i..., 0,. All Toblot" 

COffU ff,\ .MIUC Moltro D'- $vporwi.;, 
IUmtl I, 10\lS - P"!•C9••_PhY 

PRIME RIBS OF BEEF $9.50 PER PERSON , 
ITALIAH DIHHEI - 7,C EXTRA • 

ASIC ABOUT OUR SPECIAL COCKTAIL HOUR RATES 

---~ ~ 
2A.( OLD COUNTRY RD. - HICKSVILLE • 

Phone OV 1-3300. , • Per.r Petralia, Your ffo,t 
Wedding• • llanque/1 • -Tedlmonlal, • s,cla/ Functions 

tit the Old Country Mlfflor ••• 
"We furn/Jfi EVERYTHING But Tl,e U/0£" • 

l 

I 
'l 

t 

.. 

. : 



ROn r.nT CLAJ\Y (Passepartoutl, stnr In Guy LOm­
bardo' s production or Mlr.ho.e Todd' s "'Around 
Che World Jn 80 "lay11" at the .Jonca neach Marine 

IT'SNO 
' ·sECRET 

IllG 1;-.;ousTRY 

HAS 

PRICE HEDUCTIONS 

DURING SUMMER 

MO TUS . .. 

AND SO DO WE .A'f 

VILLI 
C,REME COLD WAVE 
~mplcte No Extras .. ................ : ............. ... .. .. $7.95 

. . FRO TINGS . I • • 
, ' · ··· ··••·· ··· .. ····· ···•······· ·• ·• ...... f1 Olli $7,50 
HA~R. COLORING ......... . ~ ..... : ............ from 3.50 

EXTRA SPECIAL 
PROTEJN TREA'l'MENT 

'ETTING FllEE $3.SO A MUST DURI NG HOT , • 
SUMMER DAYS ( ) 1on. Uiru Thura.) 

$1.00 .GIFT CERTIFICATE 
· Trt/1AIII IMIY 

\ P[AMANCNT WAvt 
• . , Mor, TIHlU fHURS. 
JULY t. AUGUST ONLY 

' PJ.AINVIEW 
'130 So, Oyster Bny Rd. WE 6-GOpo 

HICKSVU,1,E -s; · 
6!M ' So. Brondwny - OV 1-8760 .,. 

Use Your Franklin National Bank Charge Account 

11IJ! MID-JST.ANn TIMES 

~ pl-'~ 'l'lle ldmlnf.lCnflm ta 
eidll to llf ~eowf:C.= f?Clm atmpJy Jao&rdJns 
tie raw e 11alhlewarUmii 
'90al'Ol&l:.11::~:.,:s-~ldldaedFOl,I-
\Idla lileerta ~I' any tbenlaaalolMr ,,..,,.. ■ A . . 'ltalea-Pf.CIQ'cmll., 

Tbe 50 etarllDp wbca 
new down a ~ lD&OI 
a CaUforn1a bome ..,,. 
haft lffll Alfred JU&olt.':" 
oootte "Tbe suc,a,:•­
ArkaA1&11 Guetta: ..__._ . .... 

Tbere tan• t m11ob mutet 
any mote for 11.UD•• be 
the II.Md for cbeolt re1as 
bun't dimlnlehed.-Dal.­
ly Oklahoman 

:--....;;. ___ .....;.. _____ ..;;....;__..;.. __________ ---
SPEEDY ..: .. 1 BJtuce OLDf MOBILE 

B!uue OLDSMOBILE.91,e. 
) ~00 BROADWAY, 11/CKSVILLC. _ ( 

li 

••• lwl It ""°"'' .... )'OIi .... ■IITllY UY■IIYI .,.. ........... .,. ............ ...,,.. IECIM • ·-- ..... ·-........ _.._ ... . ... ...,. • 2:1.o:t -.... ~ ....... 
11)00 ., .. -MM -tltMeflhe,-.n.ra1e ,ooe t74.tt . t2.GI 64.n II I l,w $4.75 p« $100. 
IOOO M2A1' ISl.12 '7.11 ..., In fo, detailt, .. 
4'000 1 149,N 114.16 12'.M tloe .-..c1ow a,J.I. efflc• 5000· "'7AS 2)0-10 '"·" .. ,,.., yov. 

MEADOW BROOK B 
111 NATIONAL BANK 

ant• r• IERYE METROPOLITAN NEW YORK AND LONG ISLAND 

j 
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() U··R ·BIG 
BACK-TO-SCHOOL 

SUPRLEM·ENT 
IS NOW UNDERWAY! 

On August 26th 

your ad will 
v 

appear· in all of our 

·5 NE-WSPAPERS. 
• MID-1S~ND TIME~ 
• CENfRE ISLAND NEWS 
• SYOSSET ADVANCE 
• BETtiPAGE NEWSGRAM 
• JERICH.0 NEWS JOURNAL 

over" 25,000 CIRCULATION· 

~i~WE-1-0012 
For • Reasonable Rates • Attractive Layou~s 

Start Your FALL SEAS.ON 

wit/,-!) a BANG! 
ADVERTISE IN Ll'f MORS 

·BACK-l'O~SCHOOL. 
SUPPLEMENT 

PAMELA JUSTINE WF.JCKMAN of 17 W. John st.; 
Hicksville, was m11rricd to Allan H. Swanson last 
Saturday at lhc f.ptscopal Church of lhc Advent ln 
Westbury. Mr. Swansonl.&anArchlte~lurat Engineer. 
Qc comes from Naubua, N. H. Miss Wclckman ls 
employed by American Airlines. She Is a 1;rad11Ate 
of Green Moantaln College. Poultney, Vermont. The 
lµ-idegroom attended tbe University of New Hamp-. 
l!ibtn and gradaatcd Crom Wentworth Jni-Utute. 
A -reeepUOD. was bt!ld al the Bunllngton ·-rown lloue 

lollowiag the wedding. • · 

GENI:: MANN of 17 Wei;\ Strcol, j11cksv1i1c, 
rcc:clvcll n i.pcclnl l"chulnrs hlp nwurd from •New 
York Unlvert1lty. Thw 11w1u-d, whl<,h IR m11dc ' to 
highly qunllflcd cundldc1tei:; £or udmli;tilon 11 s Crueh­
mcn, will ltwulvc . full-lh111: pnrllelpntlon In tho, 
New York University ScholnrH progrum. New · 
York Unlvcrt11\y Sc-holars urc• scloclcd for hlgb · 
11c11dc111lc 11htllly 11nd dcmo11 i.tr11tcd qunll\l(•B ur 
ll'11deri;hlp. Mr; M11n11 will attend th • School or 
fo:ducnllon Ill NYU' :- \\lnl"hlni;lon S(1un1·t· cl·nlo,r. 
lie Is II 1-:r11duutc of lllcki;vlllc lllr,h School, lllcks­
vlllc, whor o hl' wns ll 111c 111bur of till' Nn\1011111 
llunor So ·lcty. · 

H111torl&11B tell Ult .. bout 
the paat and economists 
toll w, about the future. 
<TbWI only tbe present le 

The honeymoon Is really­
over when be JJbone11 th.at 
he'll be late !or supper.. , 
and ebe already hlle left 

j oonfuelng.--Ocllla (Ga,) ;.... _____________________________ . s~r . a note saying It' e 1n· the, 
refrigerator .--Nortb-
western Muter · 

•j 
I 
i 
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l>AGE 12 ' 

.., 

. ,If You Please 

'A Urlt l:<h IJclegnt · HJ the ll .N. went to a Mel'i. 
IJ11scboll wune recently . Jn the flri;t Inning ench 
t cnm 11corcd -j1 r un 11nd Ill two "I' :-" were pomed 
on the scor c l,onrd. From th n on It wns n tight 
~ame :\lltl twc,, l ong :;t r ing:- of 1,croi. (O's) went on 

, lhe l,onn l . ,\lung ahout th · tenth inning, the I-:ngtlsh­
m nn h11d to l eave fur a <.'Olll 111l ttcc mee ting. on his 
way out u .sm111l l>9y tl-6kcd him, "hey., whati s the 
score now'!' ' "ntc,;s me ," an i;wcrcd the Enl"llshman 

, ••I lost ull trn c~k• It ' b' wny up In the mlll1ont1.Y; •••. At a 
recent Nni;sau ·tlog i;how a s pectator usked an 
ult •ndunt to dtr,:ct ~Im lo the Lubrndors . "All the 

· wuy tlown th lfi ai sl e.'" snld the uttendnnt, " and the 
firs t tloor to . the ri ght." .••• Al the swank Country 
C.:luh Hc:<tnurnnt, 1.a.kcvlll e Hond: Jt wu,; Just like 
old tl m (• • 1t llrudJcy• s . with mck (bass ) and nob 
(pluno) 1-:Rchmnnn k noc.klng th •m 1>clvcs out to please 
the vust smnrt i:; •t o r winer s und dlnc r s .. • Harrled 
wife, figur ing at bc r desk, to husband and children: 
"Well, I wurkctl out n budget. Uut one of us will 
h n'Vc to g1 1 .'' •••• on the 1,.1 . rtallroad we overhead, 
on • mun t , anothe r : " \\le' r e a non-profit organh:11.­
tlon. We d h1' t mcun to pc - but we are." •••• Herc' s 
thli; week' .· llurold i\ppl egnter: Seems the guard 
Ul the nudli;t t::t mp hnlled n mun at the gutc. "l in 
sorry, i; lr •," he s11id " but you cun•t come In here 
wearing II blue i;ull." "\Vho' i; weurlng 11 blue suit?.' 
chutte r 1,:d the newcomer. "I'm coldr" •••• Don't let tho 
uctlons or tho1m nv'o Nns 1mu policemen accused 
of burglnry; caui;c you to think less of 'tbe other 
thou,mmls or Tine omcer1:1 . I can't atop (blnking 
11bout the ,runilllcs of tboi;c £Ive cops. ll' s Just a 
s humc , thut' s 1111. There' s no other e,q>lan11.t1on 
Rudy Zani, to a l>III: "Tcll )nc, Tom.who ls (be bu~-;; 
In your huusc't' ·rom 11.llswer ed thoughtfully, well, 
Margie nssumt:s c:omrrutnd of the chtl<lren, the tank . 
account, the dog nnd the parakeet. But I say pretty 
much whnt l please to the goldfish." •• ; .And we know 
a gent}emun who ufter n phylllcal checkuP, waa told 
by the doctor thnt hu Wlti in pretty ) 1<1d slap: 
tltU6ly: "Too little blood In your alcohol stream.•~ 
••• The Nnssnu l)emocraUc Executive Comm1tnm, 
headed by John 1'" • • Engli sh, h1u; dci;lgnnted M r . 
Hlll lnrd J . (Joe) Lenox lo 1un for thu Dlstric:&. 
Court IJt:nch. Tip to the G.O.P. thi s gent LeDDZ 
Ii; one of the must handsome und lote lllgent at­
torncyi; to be round ·unywhcr l:! . Uc uod his bqp y 
Cu rn ily n · Ide in Mnnlmi;i;c t. one or hl8 smaller 
c r edit i; incl u1.kw three ycnri; on the Fcderul Dur 
Asf;O,cl ut loni. 0 1111111ttcc ,0n Uniform l, 11ws for the 
Unalcll Sln tt·s. II •' s ulso 11 11 Utl60c lntc professor 
of l11 w al C .W. Poi;t <,;ollcgc In Dr ookvlllc. Joe 
L enox toltl 1,1 1; of u fu thcr who •found hi s 1m111ll son 
Ril l ing In f ronl of u TV Rel 1-1lutchlng n suitcni;e 
"11<• ',i; ru r111l 11 r, awuy from home;• cxplnlncd th; 
hoy• ~ rnol hl.! r "ta ll ,-;pun 11 ,-; the 11rugr·11rn' 1-1 over.'' 
..... S11 ml l lioy t<, 111 11 n11gc r 111 gu n .lc nlng-cquiprnent 
tun·: "My 1111 1111m y wnnt i; 11 1;1111 r y lhut will klll 

c:ra lJ ~r11 , t • ·ll .,., , w1·ulli; ami !lpl nttch.'' .. . .. JC 
\ uu Pl ·ui-t ·. (.;huckk. .. . . . 

w L'I-R' 92.7 MC 

GARDEN CITY, NEW YORK 
The Stereo S,Ound of Suburbia 
' PRESENTS 

"!RENDS IN INDUSTRY" 
. '.'Tret!ds 1,;' Jodum y" wm fee. rure the educated 

opm•o~ of Long h la11d's top industrial, firulllcial, and 
eduo111onal leaders on the cunenr industrial u en<b and 
~ow they aficcc lhe Long Island business clilllJt,P- The 
pr?grarn wiJl be ai red each evening .•• Monday d1rougb 
Frulay ••• frQm 7:4S to 7:SS P.M. 

.. 

mE MIO,ISL,\NO TIMES TIIURSDAY, AUGUST IS, 196~ 

SUPREME COUllT OP 
THE STATE OP NEW 
YORK 
COUNTY OF N~U ---------x 
In tho Matter of 
tile Ton. of 01Bter :ea:, 
a.oqu1rtllg the Ceo Wlea 
to oertam parcels of zeal 
property for Road Wldell­
J.llg purposes at: 

BBTHPAGE 
1ll ~ v1ciD1ty of Bcnbrt 
street. in UMt OIWl.corpor­
ated Arca of tile TOWll 01 

Oyster Bay, Nassau. 
Cowaly. New York. duly 
selected by tho 'l'OWll 
Board of Uae Town of-0,­
ster Bay for Roe.dwtdeD-
1ng · purposes, according 
to law. 
NOTICE OF INTENTION 
TO MAKEAPPLlCATlON 
TO CONDE.IIN · 
Inda No. 6212/1963 

~me c°'rc or Um 
~le ofNewy9.rkatSpcc­
l al Term cl. Uie Court 
Cor Condemnatlon there­
of, before Mr. Ju11t1oc 
Howard T. HQgan. ap­
Polnted to bQ held in and 
for tho COUDty of Nassau.. 
at .the Nassau County 
Courthouse.Mineola, New 
York, on tho 9th day of 
September, 19G3, at 9:30 
o• clock ln the forenOCB 
ot tuu oay. or ai. .,.,on 
thereafter as CO\Ul&el ~ n 
be heard, for an order- to 
condemn the r e lilies ln 
certain. parcel:e of real 
property, and ' that the 
compensation to be mlde 
to· the ownert1 of said 
real property s hall l.e 
determlnt.-d by the Sup­
reme Court without a 
Jury; the said parools of 
property are descrlbt.-d 111 

X the potlUoo andareshown 
NOTICE OF APPLICA- upon. a certain hap en­
TION FOR AN ORDER UUcd "Map Showing Real 
OF THIS COURT TO DE- property to be acquired 
Tf.'RMINE COM.PENSA - for widening Benkert 
TlON TO BE MA.DE TO ,. Street, Bethpage, Ny" 
THE OWNEBS OP THE dated Oct- 1, 19G2 : re-
REAL PROPERTY TO • 
wmcu THE F EE TITLES 

.. 
vleed Oct. 16, 196;1. 19M 
map having bee1t:Jt;fliU"'" 
ed by order of -rwa 
noard of the 1WII of 
Qyster Day. adoDted br 
ttie Town Boanf of ille 
Town of oYBter Bay.all .. 
er a publfo beart.ag ad 
med in the omoe or u. 
COUllty Clerk oftbeoa-­
t7 of, Nanu oa .JIiiy 2. 
1963. , 
Tbat the 'nJWll al~ 

nay shall becomo,...... 
with lhe fee tlUee ___.. 
to be ac:qaired in~ 
ceedlng. upoa the flllb,y of 
the Order In tbo_ ~ 
or the county Clem arJ: 
County ofNassailJID'.llldbll 
the appllcatlon la ~ 
dcmn, . • 
ATTJJ.10 E . llRAUllE • 
F,SQ~, '\ 
Town Attorney for lie · 
Town of Oyster Bay. t 
offlce and Post OU1ce Ad­
dress . . f 
Town Hall, Audrey A~ 
Oyster nay. J'\ew Yodl 
Dated: py11ter Bay. B.T. 
Augus t 5, 19G3 
DN 11690- 2X-8/l5.22 

AllE TO BE ACQUUUID 
AND TO THE VESTING 
OF TITLE 

PUBI,IC NOTICE IS 
Hl.;REBY GlVl-!N that lt 1B 
tbe Intention of the TOWn 
Attorney of tbc TOWn of 
Oyster ,Bay. Na s s a.u 
County, New York, p.ir.., 
81lllllt to the IJlghway I,aw, 
the Town I,aw. the County 
Government Law of Nas­
~ u COIDlty, the Nassau 
County Admini strative 
Code, and the amend -
mc~ts to said laws, lo 
make noollcatlon to lhe 

· PIERRE 
:· CHARBO'NNEt I 

IMJti1tctlit P/,1tt1,;,;,,, { 

• 

~CQMMERCIAl. • WEDDINGS 
• INDUSTRIAL SERVICES 

• COLOR & STEREO 
• STUDIO PORTRAITURI! 

• HOME PORTIWTUII! . 
WEiis 1-4470 - WEDs 1-4471 

3.«J Ploinvi.w Road • Hidtsv!Ue 

\ (J,lil,I~ ~EL, Inc, 
A64 fflW.ilT A'4 fflHPAGt N. Y. 

" ov,~1600· . 
, 11:--'f ... , ...... u..a • ■•rvl••• 

Plop'III •••the Golden Cup Combustion tieacf,• the MW• 
eet, aoet lllOdem concept la oll heatlnC, ~ the Ideal ' -tame-• controlled, dein, pulutlon-tr.., hotttr f11me­

~•t.t,1J-, which extracta the maximum beat from every drop of oil • 
No extra attachments or acceUOflH to buy, ; 

en TIii FIEL IILL H'6. 41~ 
·• Cle•, HealUtful Heat • 'Troubl~ Freo 

f« only ptnnlel ·• day )'OIi Ctn modtmlr• your huUn1 plant -
wlt/1 I MW Qoldtn Cup 0 11 Burner, Gd ttie complete COiden Cup 
5toty, Call today. . 


