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‘ Friday, April 22
Satellite Clinic from the Northport VA Medical Center 9

a.m. to p.m., VFW. 320 South Broadway. Also April 27.

Film, “Nicholas Nickelby,” p.m., Hicksville Library.

Saturday, April 23

Slide/ Lecture, “Famous LI Residents and their Homes,”

4 p.m.. Hicksville Library.

Sunday, April 24

Board of Fire Commissioners, 1 a.m., Headquarters E.

Marie St.

Monday, April 25
.

Registration for Mother&#3 Day Craft Workshop, to be

held on May 7 at 2 p.m., Hicksville Library. Registratio
until April 30. :

,

VFW, 8:30 p.m., 320 South Broadway, Hicksville.

Tuesday April 26

Jerusalem Ave. Seniors, 1 a.m, to p.m., Hicksville

Jewish Center, Jerusalem Ave. and Magli Dr.

Wednesday April 27

Hicksville Seniors, I a.m. to 4 p.m., Levittown Hall.

Hicksville Kiwanis, 12:15 p.m., Milleridge Inn.

Hicksville Lions, 6:30 p.m.» lannone’s, W. John St.

Hicksville Auxiliary AHRC, Fashion show and dinner, 7

p.m., Huntington Tow House.

\ Thursday, April 28

Mid Island Seniors, 1 noon to 4 p.m., Hicksville United

Methodist Churc O Country Rd. and Nelson Ave.

Hicksville Rotary, 12:15 p.m., Milleridge Inn.

Community m with Councilman Tom Clark and

Wayn Gaddy, /Asst. Supt of Construction of Nassau

n seWer- and related problem p.m.,

gg, Levittown Parkway.
PQ 9 p.m., 80 E. Barclay St.

ANOTICE TO THE COMMUNIT

On Saturda the 16th of April the Galileo Lodg was

d b vile graffiti ting from irresponsi and

Jisoriented vandal That such co could be di d

against the Galileo Lodg is inconceivable and irrational,

especi in the light of what the Galileo Lodg contrib-

utes to the March of Dimes, Gift of Sight Gift o Life, little

League St. Ignatius Bugl and Drum Corps partie for

retarded children, Blood Banks, Soccer League Bo

Scouts, Ete. all total to the tune of $10,000 each year.

if such acts of vandalism occur again, then the Galileo

Lodg will have to use the money it allocates fo all its

charitable enterprise and use it to restore the damage
areas of the Galileo Lodg building

anyone knows, sees or hears anythin concernin

this recent act of property defacement, pleas contact

Venerable Ski Monteforte, 200 Levittown Parkway,

Hicksville, or dial 931-9351.

It is distressi to notice that other building in the

immediate vicinity ef the Galileo Lodg remain

untouched by vandalism, and that only the Galile Lodg

seems to be the prime target. We are asking ourselves

why.
- Venerable Ski Monteforte

Galileo Lodg No. 2253

lof,

Vam Injured In
Fire Fighter Glen Blazo,

22, of Hicksville Fire

Departments Protection H.
& - Co. #1 was slightly
injured at the scene of a fire

that was set by the

homeowner,
The fire, in a 2-car det-

ached garage at 12 Fourth

St., Hicksville was reporte
b neighbor at 4:46 AM on

April 14, Delaye detection
of the fire led to the total

destruction of the garage.
Only the quic actions of

vamps prevente the de-
struction of nearby dwell-

ing and garages. The rear

porc of #121 Fourth St.

suffered an estimated

$3000.00 damage Total

damag to the garage was

put at $7000.00
Blazo was struck a glanc

in blow b a vehicle that

jumpe over hos lines on

Jerusalem Ave. and Fifth St.

He sustained injure to his

hand and fingers He was

taken tothe County Medical

Center b F.D. ambulance,
treated and released.

©

Meanwhile, vamps
chased the vehicle, made

Positive identification of the

vehicle, plat number and

driver and reporte back to

County Police.
As it turned out, the

driver of the vehicle’ was

homeowner Dennis Bosted
of 12 Fourth St., Hicks-
ville. He was charge with

arson. Police detectives in
their report to local papers
and other media failed to

report the injury and

charged file by fire fighters
in Blazo’s injury.

It was reported that

Bosted had violated an

order of protectio times
since March b returning to

12 Fourth St. and harass-

in his wife. Bosted set fire
to the garage with a flam-
mable liquid. His wife and

1 year old son escap the

home unharmed.
Bosted was arrested sev-

School Board Adds Twe He
PROPOSITION NO
Shall the SO ee

Budge be increased b
approximately $84,000.00
to provid for an elementar
foreig languag program in

grade four through six on

the same basis and to the

same extent such a program
was provided in the school

year 1982-19837

PROPOSITION NO. 3
Shall the School District

Bu be: inere$84,0 to provid for

guidanc counsellin serv-

ices in the elementary
school of the District on the

same basis and to the same

extent such guidanc coun-

sellin services were pro-
vided in the school year
1982-83?

The Hicksville School
District budge vote and

Schogl Board vote will be

Hicksville firefighters wet

down remains of 2 car gar-

age set afire by its owner ina

eral hours ‘later in

Patchogue
—-—

+

Fire Repor
Hicksville volunteer fire-

fighter responde to 102

alarms March 1983. There

were 4 fire calls, 55 Rescue

calls and 4 False alarms.

firefighter was injured.

Ars Blaze

famil
-

Loss:$10,0 ple va
red. (Photo by Blazo)

Fire Dept. Fund Drive Starts
The Annual Fund Drive

of the Hicksville Fire Dept
i about to start vi the mail
ONLY. Once agai the

volunteers, who serve with-
out pay are askin for resi-
dents and business dona-
-tions. the Hicksville F.D.

answers your call - will you
Now - assist them?

Propositio To Budg Vote
held on Wed.,- May-25from
1 a.m. to 1 p.m: in the

seven election districts.
- The following vacancies

are to b filled on the Board

of Education: .year term

endin June 30, 1986 last

incumbent: Mrs. Charlene
Anci; 3 year term endin
June 30, 1986, last incum-

bent, Daniel E. Arena.

Nominating petitions for

the office of membe of the

Board of Education must be

filed with the District Clerk

n later than April 25. a

A publi hearin on the

propos budg will be held

on Wed., May II at the

Hicksville Senior High
School.

Voter registration will be

held on Wed., Ma 1 from

p.m. to 8 p.m. in the seven

election districts. ’

Hicksvill Republi Clu News
B Harriet A. Maher

It’s only three short week
before our gala event—the

Club&# annual Cocktail/Din- -

ner Dance. Don’t delay,
reserve: the date...May 13

1983...on your calendars

now.

Tickets and raffles are

available from your Com-

mitteeperson or any of the

officers of the Club can ob-

tain tickets and/or raffles

for you.

We&# planning a fun-filled °

evening with delicious

food/rolling bar, music fo
your listenin and dancing

pleasure oodles of door

prizes and of course, our

well known gigantic
basket of cheer will be raffl-

ed off alon with other raffle

sweepstak prizes.

There will be lots of peopl
present— friends and

neighbors, as well as

legislator and elected of-

ficials who will be delighte
to meet and greet you.

Hurry, hurry, hurry. Pur-

chase your ticket for this af-

fair now. For onl $2 each

ou can partake in a

“Bbul repas and have an

evening of fun. Wh not pla
on a group of your friends,

NOTIC T TH COMMUNIT
On Thursda the 28th of April the publi of Hicksville is invited

meetin

mon To Clar an Wayn Gadd Asst Superinten o Con

strectio of Nassa Count D.P.W. will discus sewer-

ani relate proble suc es costs, method compani etc.

The short time you may spen at this questi an answer

sessio will certainl save you many dollars ia the end.

This meetin will toke plac at the Galile Lodg 200 Levit-

town Partwa Hicksvill W.Y startin at 8:00 P.0.

at which time Councit

neighbors and relatives

sharing their own table at

this event. On the other

hand, if you wish to attend

our Dinner Dance on your

own, w will arrange to seat

you at a congeni table of

participant

To expedit your purchas
of a ticket(s) and/or raffle

book here is a parti listing
of some of the peopl you can

contact to obtain them:

Harriet Maher ‘

433-5994
Helen Henderson

433-8265
Nick Caruso

681-1342
Mike Cianciaruso
938-8227
Bob Kluck
931-4485

Joe Jablonsk
433-190
Charles Cunningha
931-8016
Fred Vevante
931-428

Bernard Wesnofski

931-712

Hal Mayer
735-6690
Frank Gioia

Dave Smyth
433-6789.

Josep Catalano
935-6294

Thomas Gallahue
931-8979

Josep Giordano
334-8584

Sam Weiss

931-2244
Gerard Connell
938-5993

Please take note that our

Club meetin for Ma will be

held a week earlier than
usual because our Dinner.

Dance will be held on May
13. Therefore, our Club

meetin will be held on May
-6 8:30 p.m., 320&#39; Broad-

way, Hicksville in the VFW
Hall. We are planning
another timely and pertinent
guest speaker for this even-

ing. We&# tell you more

abou the program in a later

column.
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OPERAT V.F.W
By P.P.C. Carmi Somma

Thi year our Hicksville
Memorial Day and Com-

memorative Service. is

chaired by the Gier Levitt

Post (655 Jewish Wars

Veterans.

It will be held on the tradi-

tional day, Monday May 30.

We assemble* at Sears

Parking area off North
B&#3 between 8:00 a.m.

and 9:00 a.m.-and kick off

time is 9:00 a.m. sharp Our

Memorial Day Chairman’

Dan Hoison welcomes all

communit organizatio as’

Veterans groups, Fraternal

Fire Dept Polic Auxiliary

School Bands, Bo Scout,

Girl Scout. Any organiza-
tion, interested in

, partici
pating or supportin the

Annual Memorial Day
Parad contact Dan Hoison

at 935-7491 or the V.F.W.

Hall at 931-784 or call Jew-

ish Wars Veterans Comdr.
Howard Sherman at 822-

4577. To all residents of

Hicksville area come out

and chee us as we go march-

ing down B&#3 to the

Hicksville High School

Playin Field for Service at

10:30a.m. This year’ Grand

Marshall4w be out P/PC.

Frank Lotti.
On Sund Ma 29, 198

at Plainlawo Cemetery on

West Old Count in Hicks-

ville there will be a Memor-

ial Day Service for Men and

Women who died, for our

Country. On the same day at

10:00 a.m. there will be

U.V.O. Service at Eisen-

hower Park at Veterans

Memorial. All Veterans

Groups, Fraternal, and

Community Organizatio
are welcome to participat

On May 9 our Games of

Chance Chairman P.PC.

Frank Lotti and the Comdr.

Conrad F. Steers will

proudl presen a check to

the St. Ignatiu Girls Drum

& Bugl Corps from our

procee on March 12 Our

next Las Vega Nite is May
14at the Post Hall from 8:00

p-m. to 2:00 a.m.

Our Jr. Vice Comdr.

Anthony Chepak Post

Americanism Chairman,

and Co-Chairman Bill Ben-

nett are chairing this year’
V.F.W. Coloring Book

Contest and Scholarshi
.

Award Committee, “Il

Pledg Allegianc to the

Flag” Coloring Contest for

3rd and 4th Graders All 3rd

an 4th Graders in our pub
li and privat schools are

invited to participat in the

coloring book contest with

the theme “I pledg alle-

gianc to the flag.” Awards

nigh is scheduled at the
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MINT & REGULA

15

752-9230

Joy Wholesale
1650 New Highwa

Farmingdal

East Norwich Drug
1019 Oysterbay Road
East Norwich

Arrow Drug
110A Broadway
Greenlawn

JOYCO STORES
call for nearest location

‘10 Cie

i Walt Whitman Road
vilte

Cottage Pharmacy
8285 Jericho Tpke.
Woodbury

R & Oru
Beach 54!
Malverne

J.E.K. Pharmacy
24 Sherbrook Ave.

Smithtown /

Swni .

ney St.”
Huntington.St
Consumer Dru:
791 Prospect ‘Av

low Cassals

/

Prescription Center
67 Hillside Ave.

Williston Park

Surfside Chemists
1079 Beach St.
Long Beach

Fluffs Discount
22603 Merrick Ave.

Laureiton

R&amp; Dru
F966 Deer P

Abesr& nk Ave

The Apothecary
677 Wellwood

Lindenhurst

Vicaf Drug
115 Jackson
‘Syosset

cowca ate RST ET

V.F.W. Hall on Ma 23. the

Post and Ladies Auxiliary
are urge to encourage, par-.

ticipation in this patrioti
program.

The Comrades of the Post

welcome a new member,

Robert Senter, who was

with the U.S. Army in

Thailand.
Speed recovery to Com-

rade and Sister who have

been hospitalized Comdr

Conrad Steers an Martin

Stallone’s wife Anita, a

member of the Ladies

Auxiliary.
On Ma 14, at the V.F.W.

Hall from 9:00 a.m. to 1

Noon our Comdr. Conrad

F Steers is the Chairman on

Post Traumatic Stress. He

invited all Veterans to

attend. For more informa-

tion call Comdr. Conrad F.

Steers at 822-593 or the

V.F.W. Hall at 931-7843.

Ou Post has set its Installa-

tion Dance at the hall Ma
28.

Every 3d Tuesda of the

month Nassau Chapter
Vietnam Veterans of Amer-

ica hold their meetin from
8:00 p.m. to 10:30 p.m.

Ou Arme Force
Navy Machinist’s Mate

Fireman John W. Taormina,
son of Josep R. and Anita

M. Taormina of 10 Midwood

Drive, Plainview, N.Y.,

recently took par ina three-

mont patrol while deploye
to the Western Pacific.

He is a crewmember
aboard the guide missile

cruiser USS Jouett,

homeporte in San Diego.
Pvt. Guy.C Haesler, son of

Guy C. and Alice Haesler of

Acre Lan in Hicksville, has

complete a wheeled-vehicle
mechanic course at the U.S.

Army Training Center, Fort

Jackson, S.C.

During the

LEGAL NOTICE

NOTICE TO BIDDER
Please take notice that

SEALED BID PROPOS-

AL will be received and

must be stampe at the DIV-

ISION OF PURCHASE &

SUPPLY, Department of

General Services, Town of

Oyster .Bay, at its office

located on the fourth floor,

Town Hall, West Building,

Audrey Avenue, Oyster
Bay, New York, not later

than [1:00 A.M. (prevailing
time) on MAY 2. 19 fol-

lowing which time they will

be publicly opene and read

and the contract awarded as

soon thereafter as practica
ble for, DEMOLITION OF

EXISTING STRUCTURES,
SOUTH SIDE OF WEST

BARCLAY STREET,
WEST OF NEWBRIDGE
ROAD, HICKSVILLE,

N.Y. AS SPECIFIED IN

BID PROPOSAL PW -

83 - DPF 8 8271A.
ENLARGEMENT OF

STORM WATFR RE-

Notice is hereb give
that the persons herein

named have formed a

limited partnershi for the

‘transaction of business in

the State of New York and

elsewhere, and have filed a

Certificate in the Clerk&

Office of the County of Nas-

sau of which the substance is

- as folows:

1 The name of the limited

partnership is LONG

AN REALTY GROUP

course,

IL.

2 The business of the

partnersh shall be to pur-
.chase, lease, sell rent and

manage real estate.

3 The location of the

princip place of busines is

One DuPont Street, Plain-

view, New York 11803,
4 The name and resi-

dence of each member is:

JULAMAR REALTY.
CORP.. One jDuPont

Street, Piai N.Y.

11803 WALTER EIDEL-
KIND, 63 Old Brook Road,
Dix Hills, N.Y. 11746;
JEROM EDSON, c/o
Eidelkind & Levine, One

students were trained to per-

form maintenance and assist

in the repair of automotive

vehicles and associated

equipmen
His wife, Veronica, is the

daughte of John and Elsie

Oldham of Cocoa, Fla.

The private is a 197

graduat of Hicksville High
School.

Marine Lance Cpl David

W. Langan, son of Joyce A.

Langan of Murray Roa in

Hicksville has returned from

a deployme to Okinawa.

H is a member of 2nd Bat-

talion, 9th marine Regiment,
Cam pendleton, Calif.

LEGAL NOTICE

CHARGE BASIN. CROSS

ST. AND 3th St. AREA,

LOCUST VALLEY, N.Y.

AS SPECIFIED IN BID

PROPOSAL PW 1 - 83

DR 69 3785C.
A charg of $25.00 for each

bid propos noted above.

payabl to the Town, non-

refundable, will be required
for a set of plans and specifi
cations. Information for

bidders, Form of Proposal
form of contract, Plans and

Specificatio thay be seen

at or procure from the

Office of the Town Clerk,

Town Hall, East Building.
Town of Oyster Bay, New

York, 9:00 a.m. to 4:45 p.m..
Monday through Friday.
JOSEPH COLBY,.SUPERVI-
SOR; FRANK J. ANTE-

TOMASO, COMMIS-

SIONER OF /PUBLIC
WORKS, PHILIP FASUL-

LO, SUPERINTENDENT
OF PURCHASING. DA-

TED: April 15 1983.

M-4616-1 4/22 MID

DuPont Street, Plainview,

N.Y, 11803 E. FINK, c/o °

Eidelkind & Levine, One’
DuPont Street, Plainview,
N.Y. 11803.

5 The term of partnershi
|

is from December 15 1982

6 The amount of cash

contributed b each limited

partner i as follows:

__Walt Eidelkin $8,00
Jerome Edson $100,000; E.

Fink $12,000.
7 No other property i

contributed and no addi-
tional contributions are

agre to be made b any
limited partner.

8 Contribution of each

limited partner is to be

returned upo dissolution.

9 Limited partners shall

ha the right to assig
interest to general partner or

to remaining limited

partners or to an assigne
with consent of a majority of

‘remaining partners.
10 The certificate has

been sworn to b all the gen-
eral and limited partners.
Dated: March 29 1983

M&am 4601-6T 5/6 MID/ PL

Leader Re

Mes
Girl Scoutir

ville has a ve

prou herita
onl five years
Girl Scout
Savannah, Ge
ville held its fir

That first
Hicksville was

aferro. She tc

step and set

Hicksville lead
That first tre

of about twen

seventh and e

has grown to

troops today.
Th role of a

i about the s

except today
work is not lir

ing and ho

Today& leade

girl a wide va

=ftences ahd
which hel to

fora rich and |

in the future.

-
This week w

dedicated peo
service teams

who work beh

to make Girl
it is today). \

for keepin tl

heritag alive

Yo all give”
the true Girl
tion and you
appreciate

BROWNI!
#3023 Kath

Koreen Cas

Michael Ne

1 Saint Mic

seniors who v

into Delta
the national
society, on A
a music

humanities m

of Mr. &

Nealson, Bal
Hicksville.

Jonathon B

Lane, PLAI

received a ir

in economi

University |

Madison.
.

Cadet Pete

Sle Wid
shown prest

Hicksville |

appreciati
Fountain k

headed b |
and was sp
ville. The fo

available o1

jue was

Idwin.
In the pit

Library Bo

President |
Bernard Pa

Library Di
Kiwanis Cl



.
to 1

Conrad

manon

ess. He
ans to

iforma-
nrad F.

or the
1-7843.
nstalla-

all May

of the

yhapte
f Amer-

ng from
m.

d to per-
nd assist
‘omotive
ociated

a, is the

nd Elsie

la.

a 1972
lle High

1. David

Joyce A.

Roa in

ned from
inawa.

f 2nd Bat-

tegiment,
alif.

E

CROSS
AREA,

Y, N.Y.

IN BID

1 - 83

for each

above,

wn, non-

required
d specifi
tion for

&gt;ropo
‘Jans and

/ be seen

rom the

m Clerk.

Building.
fay, New

1:4 p.m.,
Friday.

UPERVI-

_

ANTE-
.M MIS-
PUBLIC
FASUL-

=NDENT
VG. DA-

33.
AID

‘lainview,
INK, c/o °

rine One’
Plainview,

artnershi
15 1982,

t of cash

ch limited
ys:

i $8,00
0,000; E.

‘operty is

no addi-
ions are

le b any

of each
is to be

solution.
ners shall

to assig
partner or

limited

) assigne
najority of

s.

icate has

Il the gen-

MID/PL

Leader Recogniti We

Messag From Ou
Girl Scoutin in Hicks-

ville has a very long and

prou heritage In 1917,

only five year after the first

Girl Scout meeting in

Savannah, Georgia Hicks-
ville held its first meeting

That first Leader in

Hicksville was Joanna Tali-

aferro. She took. the first

step and set the pace for

Hicksville leaders to follow.

That first troop, made up
of about twenty girl from

seventh and eight grade
has grown to twenty seven

troops today.
The role of a leader today

is about the same as then;

except today the badg
work is not limited to nurs-

ing and homemaking.
Today& leader offers her

girl a wide variet of expe-
“riences ahd opportunitie
which hel to prepare them

fora rich and rewarding life
in the future.

. This week we honor these

dedicated peopl and their

service teams (the peopl
wh work behind the scenes

to make Girl Scoutin what

it is today). We thank you
for keepin this wonderful

heritage alive in Hicksville.

You all giv of yoursel in

the true Girl Scout Tradi-

tion and you are greatly
appreciate .-

BROWNIE TROOPS:
#3023 Kathy Marlowe.

Koreen Cassiero, #3607

Michael Nealson is one of

19 Saint Michael’s Colleg
seniors who will be inducted

into Delta Epsilo Sigma,
the national Catholic honor

society, on April 19 Nealson,

a music history and

humanities major, is the son

of Mr. & Mrs. Thomas

Nealson, Ball Park Lane in

Hicksville.
Jonathon Berstein of Wood

Lane, PLAINVIEW, has

received a master’s degre
in economics from the

University of Wisconsin-

Madison.
®

Cadet Peter Cloon 4/C,

Sie Widder,

ih

Linda Reynolds. Nancy
Carpentiere, Donna Vil-

lazon, #3548 Theresa

DiConza, Laura Heyer,
#3611 Lola Myron Toni

Voccola, #3429 Barbara

Linnehan, Dorothy Malone,
#3369 Rosemarie Jabour,
Carol Mango, #3366 Nancy
McNamara, Anne Kessler,

#3368 Cathy Carrado, Mar-

tha Mueller, #3181 Joyc
Wanger, Eileen Sarve,

#3433 Carol Gross, #3116

Wilma Hill, Donna Probst,
#3180 Maggie Shelton,

JoAnn Radicella, #3680

Joanne Doyle, Nancy
Snyder;.#36 Janice DiF-

ilippis Catherine Pearsall,
#3129 Nancy Hoosack, Fran

Abarno, Claire Peters.

JUNIOR TROOPS:

#3515 Frances Wojtyniak,
Carleen Murphy #3401
Patricia Hannigan, Faaith
Frasca. #3117 Patricia

Dwyer. Debbie Schum-

acher, #3549 Dorris Web-

ster,Marie Dunker, #3155

Gina Diaus. Alison
Frasca, #3550 Richard Fitz-

gerald, Marie Talbott,
#3256 Paula Norton, #3003

Donna Ventruella, Sharon
Huff, Maria Rodriguez,

#3356 Ronnie Evans, Diane

Dwyer, Joanne Ferrier,
Patricia Capone

CADETTE TROOPS:
#3475 Doris Mill, Jane
LaFalcia, #3437 Florence

O th Camp
of SUNY Maritime College,
Ft. Schuyler, Bronx, and son

of Mr. and Mrs. William

Cloonan of Knowles St. -

PLAINVIEW, recently
helpe Maritime’s Varsity
Swimming Team win the

Dual Meet and League
Championsh titles in the B

Division of the Metropolita
Collegiate Swimming Con-

ference. -

In that meet, Cadet

Cloonan received two gol
medals: first plac in the

165 yar Freestyle with a

time of 17:43.17 and First
Place in the 40yard Free

Past President of the Kiwanis Clu is

shown presenti a plaqu to Eler Bean President of the

Hicksville Public Librar

and was sponsor by the

available on reques at t!

Er was designe by
Idwin.

appreciatio to the contributors

Fountain located in Kenned
ded b Kingsley Kelly, tooand ‘ a

Kiwanis Foundation of Hicks-

ated in 1979. Donors names are

he Hicksville Public Library. The

Senta Carter of Carter Studios,

ville. The fountain was dedic:

Board of Trustees, expressi
to the Hicksville Memorial

Park. The project spear-
k several years to complet

In the pictur left to right are: Mrs. Josephin Buckner,

Library Board member, Mr. Elery Bean, Library Board

President, Mr. Henry Brenge Kiwanis Club member, Dr.

Bernard Paul, Kiwanis Club member, Mr. Kenneth Barne
Library Director and Sie Widder, Past President of the

Kiwanis Club.

r Girl Sco
Marcantonio, Chery]

reegan
SENIOR TROOPS:

#301 Georg Mais, Carla

Jane Guifoyle {

TROOP ORGANIZ-
ERS: Kathy Marlowe, St.

Ignatius, Pat McCormack,
Holy Family and Dutch

Lane, Barbara Brosky Trin-

ity Lutheran, Janet James,
Willet Ave., Sall Scotto,
Burns Ave., Christine Lau-

rino, East St., Elaine

Clancy, Woodland Ave.

CONSULTANTS: Brownie,
Gina Diana Dorris Webs-

ter Marilyn Pagano Jun-

ior: Dorris Webster, Patri-
cia Hanniga Cadette: Jean

Flood, Holy Family,
RoseMarie Rodriguez

Association Chairman -

Carol Gorst, Troop Services
Chairman - Pa McCor-
mack, Pat Dwyer, Camping
Consultant - Pat Guilfoyle,

Program Chairman + Fran

Wojtyniak. Finance Chair-
man -

Chris Kani, Cookie
Chairman - Robert Rlburn,
Valendar Chairman - Chris

Kani, Carol Gorst, SME
Chairman - Mona Liguori,

QSP Chairman - Robert

Elburn, Public Relations
Chairman - Geraldine
Geannikis, Community

Registrar - Esther Ulbricht,
Uniform Exchange - Cora-

lee Smith, Bake Off - Doris

.Mill, Songs Games, Crafts,
Ceremonies - Gail Hofer.

Relay, where his split was a

50.72.
® * *

Steven I. Benson, son of

Mr. and Mrs. Albert Benson

of Millford Dr., PLAIN-

VIEW, has bee initiated in-

to Eta Chapte of Zeta Beta

Tau Fraternity at Union Col-

lege A 198 graduat of J.F.

Kenned H.S.he is an honors

student. He is studying
toward a career in law.

* * *

Nanisa Frank, daughte of

Mr. and Mgs Arthur Frank

of PLAINVIEW, a fourth-

year student at Rochester

Institute of Technology
(RIT), has complete her

Winter Quarter social work

field placeme at the YWCA

of Rochest working in the

Scho Age Parents Pro-

gram.

* s a.

Anthon J. Buonagura, a

1978 graduate of

HICKSVILLE HS., has com-

plete hi course of study at

the Academy of Aeronautics.

* . *

Susan M. Sullivan of

Garden Blvd.,

HICKSVILLE, has been

elected chairperso of The

Lion Ambassadors at Penn-

sylvani State University.
This group is comprise of

_more than 60 students whose

aim is to advance Pen State

through efforts in student

recruitment, public rela-

tions, assistance with speci
events on campus and ex-

change of ideas with Penn

State administrators and

alumni.

HH Alum Cocktail Pa
A fund raisin cocktail

party to benefit the graduat-
in boys and girl of Hicks-
ville High varsity team is

scheduled for Wicker’s on

Sunday, Ma 15th.
The Hicksville Alumni

«confronted with risin costs,

required alumni friends,

Colorin
. Book
Contest

The William M. Grouse,
Jr. VFW Post of Hicksville
i sponsorin a Voice of

Democracy coloring book

contest for all third and.

fourth grader in both the

publi and privat schools,
totaling over 1,000 potentia

contestants.

Mr. Anthony Chepa and

Mr. William Bennett are

running the activity for the

VF Post. The theme of the

coloring book is “I pledg
allegian to the flag.” $540.

in priz money will be

offered to the winners. Each

school will have three

winners. First priz will b

$20 Second priz $15 and

Third priz $10. Certificates
of accomplishm will also

be issued to all contest

winners,
The deadline for submit-

ting coloring books will be

Monday, May 2nd. The

awards will b presente at

the VF Posts, 320 South

Broadway, at p,m. on

Monday, May- 23r All

winning contestai as well
as their paren and/ rela-

tives are invited to attend.
Ms. Ruth Jacobson,

Supervisor of Reading,
Hicksville schools, “has

issued the coloring books to

each of the public and pri
vate schools.

For further information,

contact Ms. Ruth Jacobson

at 733-2102 during the day
or Bill Bennett,in the even-

ing at 681-318 Mr

Anthony Chepa Jr., Vi

Commander of the VF

Post, will act as program
chairman for the May 23rd

award presentatio His

pho i 931-2181.

parents, Hicksville business

to join in the effort to con-

tinue the recognition of
Hicksville students at an

annual dinner.
Tickets are $12.50 per

peson and it will be held
from 5:30 p.m. to’7:30 p.m.

Milton Levitt is chairman
of the party.

Tickets can be obtained
from any member of the

Board of Directors: Harold

Holden, Dorothy Brengel
Henry C. Brenge Ellen

Bruwer, Dolores Crawford,
Howard Finnegan Hele I.

Guckenberger, Richard

Hogan Lester Iehle, Marge
McGuirk, Irene Stoffel,
Conrad Weyer Georg Zul-
kofske, William Geyer,

Josep Gentile, James Fyfe
Karen: Weyer or Gwen
Schaaf.

O Th Camp
Sandra Stryker a junior

business administration
maj and the daught of a

long distance runner on the”
«women’s track and field

team at Messiah College
Grantham, Pa.
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It& the finest disposer we&#3 ever

made. So whether you&
installing your first disposer O

replacin a worn-out model, the

In-Sink-Erator stainless steel

Classic gives you more. Grinds

an liquefié all food waste faster
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i Dear Friend
ai

IMPORTANT NOTICE

Tw paragraphs have been adde to the Hicksville School

District leg this week. as a result of a speci Board of

Education meetin held for this purpose on Tuesda night,
as follows:

PROPOSITION No. 2....Shall the School District budge
be increase by approximatel $84,000.00 to provid for an

elementary foreign language program in grade 4 through 6

on thesame basis and to the same extent such a program was

providé in the school yea ‘82-83?
D

—
i

AN 7

PROPOSITION No. 3....Shall the school district bidg
be increased b $84.000.00 to provid for guidanc Couns

in service in the elementary schools of the District on the

same basis and to the same extent such guidanc counselin
_servic were provide in the school yea ‘82-83?

W see no reason wh these items should have bee left

out in the first place However, b listin them as separate

propositio the voters of this district will be able to decide

for themselves as to whether or not they wish the children of

Hicksville to Continue to have&#3 qualit of education that

they have had in the past.
MARK YOUR CALENDARS, PLEASE: Thursday, May
is the regular May meeting of the Hicksville Communit

Council which i scheduled for pm downstairs at the

Hicksville: Library. Part of the program this month will

focus on school board candidates and the propose school

budget Of course, all local communit proble and zoning
matters will be reviewed, as presente The meetin starts at

8 pm sharp
* * * =

_A REMINDER: This Sunda at am is the time to put

your clock AHEAD one hour, for daylight saving tim will

- then be with us once again Don& forget —

* & * #

4A

-THAT&#3 AL for this week. Sta well and remember the

old adag Start each constructive criticism with honest

praise.
SHEILA NOETH

—letter to the Editor -

Dear Editor:
Since he Hicksville School

District has now reached a

serious crossroad with

regard to its educational

future. I, Lawrence I. Wolf-

son, am announcing my

candidacy for the Hicksville
School Board.

During the past twenty

years. have been active and

deepl committed to the

education o the children of
’ Hicksville. My backgroun

as an attorney, accountant
and business man during the

pas thirty years will enable

m to brin the Board a

broad prospecti and expe-

rience. This is essential in

applyin such knowledg to

the critical decision making,

policy making and long

range plannin involved

M philosophy. thoughts,
and actions have always

been and alway will be

those of an “advocate of

education”. As an officer

and member of organiza-
tions. as well as chairman‘of

the CitizensAdvisory Budge
Committee, have contrib-

uted suggestions and

recommendations to the

School Board. Although
these involvements have had

some impact, it is now

obvious that the philosophy
and future planning is’

depende upon th critical

decisions of the Board of

Education.
Based upo the urging of

many communit leaders,

decided to announce my

candidac to run for the

School Board, running for

the seat presentl held b
Daniel E. Arena. lam run-

ning as an independen can-

didate. | welcome the sup-

port of all residents,

members of the schoo] fam-

il and any groups and

organization interested in

quality education. fiscal

soundness and a, School

Board responsive to the

needs of the community
Yours truly.

LAWRENCE]. WOLFSON

Jones Manor Ope --

Is It Enough
‘B Rosemary Grant
The Jones Fun is operat-

in a hom for poor peopl
agai at the Jones Manor on--

the Sound in Bayvill The’

fund purchase an existing
adult home, Tareyton
Manor, licetised for 46 beds,

and bega operation on

March 8.

The Fund, controlled b
trustees, was set up in com-

plianc with the will of

Samuel Jones, who, in 1836

left $30,000 for the support
of the poor. The fund has

grown to $2.8 million. Jones

Institute on West John

Street in Hicksville was sold

in 1980, after 5 residents

were relocated.
John Dawson, Chairman

of the Fund&# Trustees said

“No specifi contact has

been made with the former

residents. The have made

new accommodations.” He

added there are no pla to

increase the amount of beds

and th are in the prospects

Stamp

“of gettin familiar with staff

requirement He sees’a nee
for a recreational program

.at the facility.’ He will seek

volunteer services, although
no invitation has been

extended to groups who

have volunteered .at the

-Hicksville Institute.
A coalition of community

groups challenge the sale of

the Hicksville Jone Insti-

tute in court and lost, New

York state droppe a law-

suit again the Jones Fund

to requir them to open a

new home when the Jone
Manor on the Sound bega
operation 4

Th trustees have fulfilled

lega requirement yet ques-
tions bein raised by com-

munity groups are more

moral tha legal. The Fund,:
which has grown to $2.8 mil-

lion, producin an income

of $200,000 a year mig be

able to aid more:; poor than

the 46 beds for which Jones

Manor is licensed.

One way to hel in our

recessionar times would be

to offer emergency shelter to

the homeless. According to

a preliminar survey of 3

volunteer agenci released

on April 13 198 by the

Nassau Action Coalition, at

least 5.000 county residents

needed emergency shelter

last year.
“Money doesn’t belon in

bank, it belong in services

and facilities for the poor.”
said Herb Klein of Hicks-

ville, a community member

who oppose th sale of the

original institute, He

summed up his feeling
“Here is $2 1/ million that

is privat money, that is not

taxpayers money. Here isan

opportunit to. provid for

the poor that would not cost

the taxpayers anything The

trustees should not be sitting
on that money.”

Arthur Dobrin, Leader of

the Ethical Humanist

Society of Long Island,

Unfold A Interestin
Histor Lesson

Hot air balloons are the

colorful subjec of a block of

20-cent commemorative

stamps now available at the

main post office and all

branches and stations.
The .stampsi feature

modern ho air balloon plu
the Intrepid, a Civil War bal-

loon, and the Explorer II.
which made its. flight \in
1935.

Th Intrepid is considefed

to have been th first aircraft”

used for military purposes in

the United States. President

Lincoln was convinced b
Thaddeus S. C. Lowe. a pro-
fessor, to fund a military bal-

loon observer corps which

was headed by Lowe.

Shortly thereafter, the Con-

federacy countered, with

their own balloons. JTh

the Civil War became the

first American war in which

aircraft were used.

Lowe&# balloon corps

grew to include seven bal-

loons and more than 200

soldiers. The balloons were

filled with hydroge gas

generate with acid and iron

in horse-drawn carts which

had been built specificall
for this purpose

Some 100 years later, the

Explorer was launched. A

joint U.S. Army and

National Geographic
Societ sponsored flight, the

balloon took off in 1935

from a rock depressio near

Rapid City, South Dakota.

On board with Captain
Albert W. Stevens and Orvil

A. Anderson were many

scientific instruments and

biological test equipment
The purpose of the flight

was to stud stratospheri
gamma rays, radio trans-

missions and to determin if

spores could survive in the

stratosphere. Reaching
72.395 feet, it set a world

record for altitude. When it

landed some 225 miles away.
the balloon was swarmed b
spectators from nearby
White lakes, South Dakota.

as well as enthusiasts who

had followed the balloon

from the launch.

The stamp were designe
b Davis Meltzer, a Pen-

nsylvani freelance artist
who is associated with the

National Geographic
Society

would like to at least see as

many new bed as possibl
added to Jones Manor and

to have their budget made

public He emphasiz the

lack of beds for the poor in

Nassau County and said in

essence the taking over of

this facility resulted in a net

loss of 50 beds. He will con-

tinue to be involved in the

presen da problem of the

poor. “We are goin to make

sure that the Jones Institute

i not forgotten. he said.
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LEGAL NOTIC

THE PEOPLE OF

THE STATE OF
NEW YORK

BY THE

GRACE OF GOD

FREE AND
|

INDEPENDENT
TO ATTORNEY GEN-

ERAL OF THE STATE

OF NEW YORK, SAL-
VATORE ODDO. PUB-

LIC ADMINISTRA-

TOR OF THE COUNTY

OF NASSAU, and any
and all unknown distri-
butees, heirs-at-law and

next-of-kin of SER-
RALL W. HOREY.

fieceased, if living, whose

names and/or plac of

residence and post office
addresses are unknown

to petition herein, an if

any of the said distribu-

tees heirs-at-law or next-

of-kin of SERRALL W.

HOREY., deceased. be

dead. their lega repre-
sentatives, their hubands

or wives, if any, distribu-

tees and successors in

interest, whose names

and/or place of resi-

dence and post office

addresses are unknown

and cannot. after diligent
inquiry, be ascertained

b the petitioner the dis-

LEGAL NOTICE

tributees of SERRALL

W. HOREY, deceased
GREETINGS:

WHEREAS, ALFRED J.

SKIDMORE who is domi-
ciled at 1 Sunset Lane,

Levittow New York, has

lately applie to the Surro-

gate’ Court of our County
of Nassau, to hav a certain

instrument in writing bear-

ing the date the 3rd day of

February, 1975 relatin to

both real and personal
property duly proved as the

Last Will and Testament of

SERRALL W. HOREY

deceased who was at the

time of his death domiciled

at 335 West Old Country
Road, Hicksville, New. York
in said County of Nassau.

THEREFORE, you, and
each of you, are cited to

show cause before the Sur-

rogate’s Court of our

Count of Nassau, at the

Surrogate’s Court, Nassau

County Court House, at

Mineola inthe Count of

Nass on the 27th da of
April 1983 at 9:30 A.M. of
that da wh the said Will
and Testament should not
beadmitte to probat as a
Will of real and persona
property.

INTESTIMONY WHERE-

LEGAL NOTICE

OF, We have caused the

seal of the Surrogate’s
Court of our said County
of Nassau to be hereunto

affixed.
WITNESS, HON. C.

RAYMOND RADI-

GAN, Judge of the Sur-

rogate’ Court of our said

County of Nassau, at the

Surrogate’s Office, at

Mineola, in the said

County, the 17th da of
March 1983.

SEAL
LS.

JOHN DINOTO

CLERK OF THE

SURROGATE&#39; COURT

This citation is serve
upon you as require by
law. You are not oblige
to appear in person. If

yo fail to appear, it will

be assumed that you con-

sent to the proceedin
unless you file written

verified objections
thereto. You hav a right

to have an attorney-at-
law appear for you.

ALFRED J. SKIDMORE
ATTORNEY FOR
PETITIONER,
OFFICE & P.O. ADDRESS

11 Newbridg Road

Hicksville, N.Y. 1180
M-4588-4T 4/21 MID

BIALOW
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The Pow of Purpos
With wealthy parents and

person beauty, Florence

Nightingal was destined to

become

a

sheltered British
socfalite. She became,

instead, a nurse and left Eng-
land for the Barrack Hospi
tal in the Crime to tend to

thousands of wounded Brit-

ish soliders under deplora
ble conditions.

Her biographer, Cecil

Woodham-Smith, wrote of

Miss Nightingale adventu-

res: “In January, 1855.

there were 12,00 men in

hospital and onl 11,000 in

the camp before Sebastopol
and still the shipload came

pourin down... In this

emergency she (Florence
Nightingale) became

supreme. She was the rock

to which everyone clung...
The doctors came to be

absolutely depende on her

.

She asked nothing for

LEGALNOTICE
NOTICE IS HEREBY

GIVE that the resolution

publishe herewith has been

adopted by the Town Board

of the Town of Oyster Bay,
Nassau County, New York,

on April 12 1983 and the °

validity of the obligations
authorized b such resolu-

tion may be hereafter con-

tested only if such obliga-
tions were authorized for an

object or purpose for which

said Town is not authorized.
to expen money, or if the

provision of law which

should have been complie
with as of the date of,publi-
catio of this notice were not

substantially complie with,

and a action, suit or pro-

ceeding contesting such

validity is commenced
within twenty da after the

date of publicatio of this

notice, or such obligation
were authorized in violation

of the provisio of the

Constitution.
Dated: Oyste Bay,
New York,

April 12 1983
ANN R. OCKER

Town Clerk
RESOLUTION
NO. 354A-1983.

BOND RESOLUTION
DATED April 12 1983.

A RESOLUTION AUTH-

ORIZING THE ISSU-

ANCE OF $1,110,000
SERIAL BOND OF THE

TOW OF OYSTE BAY.

NASSAU COUNTY, NEW

YORK, TO PAY -THE

COST OF THE INCREASE

AND IMPROVEMENT
OF TH FACILITIES OF

THE TOWN OF OYSTER
BAY PUBLIC LIGHTING
DISTRICT IN SAID

TOWN. -—

WHEREAS, pursuant to

proceedin heretofore had

and taken, and more partic-
ularly an order dated March

.22, 1983, the Town Board of

the Town of Oyster Bay,

Nassau County, New York,

has determine it to be in the

ublic interest to increase

and improv the facilities of

the Town of Oyste Bay
Public Lighting District in

said Town, consisting of the

installation of additional

undergroun cables, light

OTIONS 6y The Rev. Tom G

o si

herself, nor did sh use her

influence to mak life easier

for herself... When

a

flood of

sick came in she was on her

feet for twenty-four hours at

a stretch. She was known to

pass eigh hours on her

knees dressin wounds.”

What was it that cause

Florence Nighting to live

the way sh lived? Why did

she serve in such dramatic
fashion?

The answer to these ques-

tions i simpl Florence

Nightingal was driven b a

strong sense of purpose.
Go is purposef And of

all living creatures, man Is

most like the Creator in his

ability to set goal and

pursue them intelligently
Som psychologist believe

that man cannot live a

rational life without a clear

and strong sense of purpose.
In Mark 10:32 - 3 we find

LEGAL NOTI
in standards with lumi-

naires, conduit piping and

other appurtenant and

incidental equipment and

fixtures, and
WHEREAS, it i now

desired to authorize such

increase and improvemen
of facilities and to provid
for the financing thereof;

NOW, THEREFORE, BE

IT
RESOLVED, by the

Town Board:of the Town of

Oyster Bay, Nassau County,
Ne York, as follows:

Sectio 1. The specifi
objec or purpose to be

financed pursua to this

resolution is the increase

and improvemen of the

facilities of the Town of Oys
ter Ba Public Lightin Dis-

trict of the Town of Oyster
Bay, Nassau County, New

York, consisting of the

installation of additional

undergroun cables, light-
ing standards with lumi-

naires, conduit piping and

other appurtenant and

incidental equipmen and

fixtures.
ti The maximum

estimated cost of such spe-

cific objec or purpose i

$1,110,000 and the pla for

the financing thereof is b
the issuance of $1,110,00
serial bonds of said Town,

hereb authorized to be

issued pursuant to the Local

Finance Law. Further

details pertainin to said

bonds will be prescrib ina

further resolution or resolu-

tions of this Town Board.

Section
3.

lt is hereb
determined that the perio
of probabl usefulne of the

aforesaid specifi objec or

purpose is thirty years, pur-

suant to subdivision of the

Local Finance Law. It is

hereb further determined
that the maximum maturity
of the serial bonds herein

authorized will exceed five

years.
Sectio 4 The faith an -

credit of said Town of Oys
ter Bay Nassau County,
New York, are hereb irre-
vocably pledge for the

paymen of the princip of

.(Continued on Pag 9)

« Jesus exhibit a strong
sense of purpose. We can

note in these verses three

oodlet characteristics in the life of

one who is driven b the

B power of purpose.
First, we‘ see that the

powe of purpose can cause

a person to walk alone at

times. Jesus was walking
alone to Jerusalem where he

would ultimately accomp-
lish His purpose, at the

Cross. Others followed Him

-on this journey, but from a

safe distance. Anyone pos-

purpose. For the Christian,
this means living for Christ

when others won&#
... livin

by His moral principle
whe others refuse.

Secondly we learn from

Mark 1 that the power of

purpose can make a perso
steadfas

.
Steadfastness is

faithfulness to a cause.

According to. Luke 9:51

Jesu steadfastl set His face

toward Jerusalem. Man&

opportunit for salvation is

a result of His steadfastnes
toward His purpose. We

sessed by the power of pur--
thank God for this And

pose, especiall the Chris-

tian who is possess by the

powe of Gad’ purpose for

his life, will’ have to walk

alone at times toward that

God will thank us to be

equally steadfa in our

commitment to His purpose
for our lives. If a person i

drench in the powe of his

PHILIP D. HAYWARD

Philip D. Haywar of

Plainview died on April 15

He was the husband of

Corinne; father of Philip,
Joseph and Joanna, son of

Philip L. and Mimma Hay-
ward; brother of Josep and

Donald.
He repose at the Plain-

view Funeral Home, Old

Country Rd. Mass of the

Christian Burial was at St.

Pius X R. C. Church an

interment followed in St.

John’s Cemetery.

EVERETT C. BARTOW
Everett C. Bartow of

Hicksville died on April 14

He was the husband of”

Hannah: father of Lora,

Paul, Mary and Alan;
brother of Kenneth.

H reposed at the Thomas

F. Dalton Funeral Home,
Jerusalem Ave., Hicksville.

Mas of the Christian Burial

was at St. Ignatiu R. C.

Church and interment fol-

lowed in Calverton National

Cemetery.

TERRENCE M. TROY
Terence M. Troy of

Hicksville died recently He

was the son of Anne and

John Troy; brether of

Timothy, Mary Anne,

Kevin and Peter; uncle of

Meghan
He repose at the Thomas

F. Dalton Funeral Home,

Jerusalem Ave., Hicksville.
Mas of the Christian Burial

was at St. Ignati R. C.

Church and interment fol-

lowed in St. John’s

Cemetery.

ANTHONY J. DuBRITZ

Anthony J. DuBritz of

Plainview died on April 13

He was the husband of

Joanna (ne Adessio) father
of Michael A. DuBritz,

Annette Yules and Frances

Convey; brother of Mary

Aquavella, Julia Calen-

drilla, Ros DuBritz and

Margaret Farnum; grand
father of Lisa, Debra,

Michael J. DuBritz, Ken-

neth and Robert Convey.
H reposed at the Henry

J. Stock Funeral Home,

Newbridg Rd., Hicksville.

Mas of the Christian Burial

was at Our Lady of Mercy
R. C. Church and interment

followed in Holy Rood

Cemetery.

MADELINE HELLBERG
A former Hicksville resi-

dent, Madeline Hellberg
died on April 18 She was

the wife of the late Edwin;

mother of Raymon Hel-

Iber and Doris Saxton; sis-

ter of Marie Fitzpatric She

i also survived b eigh
grandchildren an four

_great-
She repose at the Henry

J. Stock Funeral Home,

Newbridg Rd., Hicksville.

Mas of the Christian Burial

was at St. Ignatiu R. C.

Church and interment fol-

lowed at L National

Cemetery.

NANETTE MAURO
Nanette Mauro of Hicks-

ville died on April 17 She

was the wife of Alfred;

mother of Regina
Mrs, Mauro was a long

Obituari

purpose, then it shouldbe
evident in his - com-

mitment to tha purpose.
Likewise, if a Christian is

drenched in the power of

God& purpose, it should be

evident in a person every

day actions of

-

steadfa
commitment.

Thirdly, the power of

purpose give a person mag-

netism, as we find was the

case for Jesus in Mark 10

The disciple were amazed

and afraid, yet they followed

the Christ. Like Jesus, peo-

pl who are dominated by
the power of their purpose
will draw thers unto them.

The way they live draws:

admiration and the desire

for imitation. Christians

-should therefore be peopl
who, because they are

engulfe in the power of

God& purpose,
i

draw others to follow them.

Everyma needs a sense

of purpose. And there is no

greater purpose for man’s
life than that which God

give
Allow the power of God’s

purpos to reig in your life.

If, need’s be, walk alone to:

accomplis this purpose.
Determin to walk ipa
fast manner, mever com-

promisin and never alter-

in your Christ-like walk.

Walk thro life with

Jesus in tHe light of His

purpose, and attract others

to follow yo into Hi glory.

time teacher of music and

pian
Sh reposed at the Vernon:

C. Wagner Funeral Home,

Old CountryRd., Hicksville.

Baier cue

Funeral Homes Inc.
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World Games
For The Deaf

Austin Travel has been

appointed the Official

Travel Agenc for the Uni-

ted States Committee for the

World Games For The

Deaf. ‘William Simpson,
Chairman of the United

States Committee, who

announced the selection,

said that the Long Island,

N.Y. based travel, agency
chain, which was selected

after an extensive search,

will be responsi for all

travel arrangements for the

Committee and Team to

both the &q Tryouts and the

Games.

Approximate 41 nations

nearl 2500 athletes are

expecte to participat with

the U.S. Team alone

LEGAL NOTICE

NOTICE OF

ANNUAL DISTRICT
ELECTION

PLAINVIEW-
OLD BETHPAGE

CENTRAL SCHOOL
DISTRICT

_

PLAINVIEW,
NEW YORK

NOTICE IS HEREBY

«GIVE that pursuant to the

resolutio of the Board of

Education of Plainview-Old
Bethpag Central School

District, Plainview, New

York, adopte March 7th,

198 the Annual District

Election of the qualifie
voters of this School District

will be held on May IIth,

1983 between the hours of

10:0 o’clock A.M. (D.S.T.)
and 10°00 o&#39;cl P.M.

(D.S.T.) in the three Elec-

tion District stated below,
for the purpose of voting
upon the following
proposition

PROPOSITION NO. |

Shall the school district

budge for the school year

1983-1984 propose b the

Board of Education in

accordance with Section
1716 of the Education Law

be approve and a tax be

levied in the amount of

expenditur less estimated

state arid feder aid and

fund legally available from

_

other sources.

PROPOSITION NO. 2

(a Shall the Board of

Education be.empower to

establish a Capito Reserve

Fund to implement a

Capito Improvement Pro-

gram in connection with an

~& enclosure for th kinder-

garten area at the Parkway
Elementary School and the

preparati of plan and

specifications for the

replaceme of the Parkway
School roof and the Jamaica

Avenue School roof and to

expen therefrom including
prelimina costs and costs

incidental thereto and the

financing thereof, an

amount not to’ exceed the

estimated cost of Sixty-
two Thousand Dollars
($62,000.00 (b) The total

cost of said specifi objec or

purpose is Sixty-two Thou-

sand Dollars ($62,000.0 to

be pai through the transfer

of said sum from the Dis-

trict’s Repai Reserve Fund

préviousl established b
the Board of Education; (c
The probabl term for the

Tak of the funds

referred to herein shall be-on

or before June 30th, 1985

(d) The enactment of this

propositio will result in no

expecte to field a team of

250 athletes, coaches and

officials.
The World Games for the

Deaf. an “Olympic” type

competition began in Paris

in 1924 with nine nations

participatin The United

States did not compete until

1935 when the Games were

held in London. The first

U.S. team consisted of only
two athletes.

During XIV World

Games held in Cologne,
West Germany in 1981, 2100

athletes compete repres-

enting 32 countries. More

than 16,000 peopl turned

out to see the competitio in

swimming, track, tennis,

volleyball, baskétball,

increase in the budg
referred to in Proposition
No. I.

PROPOSITION NO. 3

Shall the Library Budget
propos by the Board of

Trustees of the Public

Library of the District, be

approve and a tax on the

taxable property of the Dis-

trict be levied therefor pur-
suant t the terms of Section

259 of the Education Law.

sNOTICE IS FURTHER
GIVE that petitions, nom-

inating candidates for the

office of member of the

Board of Education and

member of the Board of

Trustees of the Library must

be filed with the Clerk of the

School District no later than

thirty (30) days before the

“Anal meeting A separate
petitio shall be require to

nominate a candidate to

each separate office. Each

petitio shall be directed to

~ the Clerk of the School Dis-

trict, shall b signe b at

leas fifty-one (51 (the same

bein two (2% percent of

the number of qualifie
voters who voted in the pre-
vious election) qualified
voters of th district, shall

state the residence of each

signet the name and resi-

dence of the candidate, and

describe the specifi vacancy

for which the candidate i

nominated, which descrip
tion shall include at least the

length of the term of the

office and name of the last

incumbent.Forms of peti
tions. for School Board

members may be obtained

from the Clerk of the School

District. Forms of petitio
for Library Board Trustees

may be obtained at the

Library any weekda from

9:00 A.M. to 4 P.M.

The following vacancies

are to be filled on the Board
of Education;

3- term endin June

30th, 1986
Last incumbent: Josep
M Blum

3- term ending June

30th, 1986:

Last incument:* Susan

Sherer

3- term ending June

30th, 198
Last incumbent: Mitchell
Laub
The following vacancy is

to b filled on the Board of

Library Trustees:

‘5- term endin June

30th, 1988
Last incumbent: Michael
Polansk

NOTICE IS FURTHER

GIVE that Personal Reg

The U.S. and Polish basketball teams compete during

finals at the XIV World Games for the Deaf held in Cologne,

West Germany in 1981. The next Summer Games, expecte

to attract 2500 athletes, are schedule for July of 198 in Los

Angeles oO

istration and Election Dis-

tricts have been established

in the school District, that

no perso shall be entitled to

vote at the (Annual District
Electio whose name does

not appear on the register of

the school District, and that

those qualified to registe
and vote shall do so in the

School District in which

the reside.
NOTICE IS FURTHER

GIVE that copie of the

statement of estimated

expense for the school year
1983-1984 may be obtained

b any taxpayer in the Dis-

trict at each school house in

the District dail except
Saturday and Sunda on

and .after May 4th, 198

between 9:00 A.M. to 4:00

P.M.. and that copies of the

estimated expenses of the

Library for the year 1983-

1984 may be obtained at the

Library on and after May
4th, 1983 on any weekda
from 9:00 A.M. to 4:00 P.M.

and that any other proposi
tions to be voted upon are

available for inspectio b

any taxpayer in the district

at each school house in the,

District daily except Satur-

day and Sunday onand after

Ma 4th, 1983, between 9:00

A.M. and 4:00 P.M.

NOTICE IS FURTHER
GIVEN tha a publi hear-

in shall be held on April
.

20th, 1983 at Plainview-Old

Bethpag High School for

the purpose of discussion of

the expenditu of funds and

the budgetin thereof.

NOTICE IS FURTHER
GIVEN that the Board of

Registratio shall meet in

the three (3 election dis-

tricts described below on:

May 3rd, 1983 from

12:00 noon until 10:00 P.M.

(D.S.T.).
Any person shall be

entitled to have his name

place upon such registe
provide that at such meet-

in of the Boar of Registr
tion he proves to the satis-

faction of such Board of

Registratio to be then or

thereafter entitled to vote at

the school meetin or elec-

tion for which such registe
is prepare Said regist
will be filed in the office of

the Clerk of the District on

May 4th, 1983 and will be

ope for inspectio b any

qualifie voter of the Dis-

trict from 9:00 A.M. to 4:00

P.M. on any week da from

May 4th, 198 up to and

includin May 11th 1983.

Residents who voted at an

annual or speci meetin of

the District within two vears

from the date of the current °

annual meeting or who reg-
istered unde the provision
of Section 362 of the Elec-

tion Law, need not registe
to be eligibl to vote at the

meetin
Application for absentee

ballots fo election of board

members may be applie for

at the office of the Clerk of

the District. A list of all per-
sons to whom absentee bal-

lots are issued will be availa-
ble in the office of the Clerk

on May 4th, Sth, 6th, 9th

and 10th, Suc list will also

be poste at the pollin place(
at the election of members of

the Board of Education.

Eligibl voters attendin
either of the twodistrict hig
schools may register at their

hig school between the

hours of 9:00 A.M. and 2:00

P.M. on Ma 3rd, 1983
NOTICE IS FURTHER

GIVE that durin the vot-

in hours on Ma I Ith, 198

the Board of Registratio
will meet in the various elec-

tion disrtricts to receive reg-
istration for the ensuin
year.

SCHOOL ELECTION
DISTRICTS

The boundaries of the

school election districts, as

adopte b resolution of the

Board of Education and th
plac m each election district

for registrati and votin
shall be as follows:

ELECTION DISTRICT
- JAMAICA

AVENUE SCHOOL
BEGINNING at a poin

where South Oyste Ba
Roa intersects the dividing
line between Plainview-Old -

Bethpag Central School

District, Plainview, New

York and Bethpag Union
Free School District, Beth-

page, New York; thence ina

northerly direction along
the center line of South Oys-
ter Rav Roa to an intersec-

tion with the center line of

Woodbury Road; thence in

a generall northeasterl
direction alon the center

line of Woodbury Road toa

point dividing Syoss Cen-
tral School District,
Syosse New York from

Plainview-Old Bethpage
Central School District,
Plainview, New York;

thence in a generall south-

easterl direction alon the

line which divides Syoss
Central School District,

Syosse New York and

Plainview-Old Bethpag
Central School District,
Plainview, New York,

thenc in a generall north-
easterl direction along the

“Runnin Your First Marathon”
All runners who will be

attemptin their first mara-

thon in this Spring News-

da Lon Island Marathon

are invited to attend a spe-
cial Clinic on “Running
Your First Marathon”. The

Clinic is sponsore b the

Plainview-Old Bethpag
Road Runners Club, and

will be held at the P.O.B.

shooting, wrestling soccer,

water polo bicycl racin
and handball. In 1981, the

United States team won 11

medals, topping its own

record of 10 set in 1977

Arrangements for travel

to the Games and further

details may be obtained by
calling Austin Travel’s Toll

Free T.T.Y.-equipped
number, 800-645-7466. In

N.Y., call (516 752-9100.

line dividing Syoss Central

School District, Syosset
New York and Plainview-
Old Bethpage Central
School District, Plainview,
New York to th center line

of Seaford-Oyster Bay
Expressway thence in a

generall southerly direc-

tion along the center line of

the Seaford-Oyster Bay
Expresswa toa poin which

divides Plainview-Old
Bethpag Central School

District, Plainview, New

York from Bethpag Union

Free School District, Beth-

page, New York; thence ina

generall westerl direction

alon the boundar line

which divides Plainview-

Old Bethpage Central
School District, Plainview,

New York from Bethpag
Union Free Schoo! District,

Bethpag New York to its

intersection with South Oys
ter Ba Road; said poin
being plac of beginning
ELECTION DISTRICT

NO. 2 - JOYCE ROAD
SCHOOL

BEGINNING at a poin
in the center of the Seaford-

Oyster Bay Expressway
which divides Syosse Cen-
tral School District,

Syosset New York from

Plainview-Old Bethpage
Central Schoo! District.
Plainview, New York,

thence in a generall south-

erly direction along the cen-

ter line of the Seaford-

Oyster Bay Expressway to a

point which divides
Plainview-Old Bethpage

Central School District,
Plainview, New York from

Bethpage Union Free

School District, Bethpage
New York; thence in an

easterl direction alon the

line which divides Plainview-
Old Bethpage Central
School District, Plainview,
New York from Bethpag
Union Free School District,
Bethpage New York to a

poin in the center of Plain-

view Road; thence in a gen-
erally northerly direction

along the center line of

Plainview Roa to its.inter-
section at the center line of

Ol Country Road; thence

in a generall easterl direc-

tion alon the center line of
Old Country Road to ‘it

intersection with the

Nassau-Suffolk County
lin thence in a generall
northerly direction alon
the Nassau-Suffolk County
line to a poin where Syoss
Central School District,

Syosset. New York,
Plainview-Old Bethpage

Central School District,

Public Library on Tuesda
evening April 26 at 8:00

PM.

The Clinic will feature a

“last minute” preparatio
on what to expect, what to

wear, eat, etc., howto runan

intelligent marathon and to

get the most out of all the

training you& been goin
through Veteran sub-3 hour

marathoner Howie Green-

berg will be on hand to

answer all your question
and to provid valuable

insights from someone

who& “been there” many

times.

The Clinic is free of

charg and open to eve-

ryone. It’s a must for Long
Vsland Marathon first

timers!

Plainview, New York and

the county line meet; thence

ina generall westerl direc-

tion alon a boundary line
which divides Syoss Cen-

tral School District.

Syosse New York and

Plainview-Old Bethpag
Central School District.
Plainview, New York to the

point in the center of the

Seaford- Ba Expressw
the point or place of

beginnin :

ELECTION DISTRICT
NO 3 - OLD BETHPAGE

SCHOOL
BEGINNING at a poin

on the center of Plainview

Road which divides
Plainview-Old Bethpag

Central School District,
Plainview, New York from

Bethpage Union Free

School District, Bethpage,
New York; thence in a gen-

erally northerl direction

along the center line of

Plainview Roa to its inter-

section with the center line

of Old ,Country Road,
thence ina generall easterl
direction along the center

line of Old Country Roa to

a point where Old Country
Roa interséct with Nassau-

Suffolk County line; thence

in a generall southerly
direction along the Nassau-

Suffolk County line to a

poin where Plainview-Old
Bethpag Central School
District, Plainview, New

York, Farmingdal Union

Free School District, Farm-

ingdale New Yor and the

Nassau-Suffolk County line
meet; thence in a generall
westerl direction along the

boundary: line dividing
Plainview-Old Bethpage

Central School District.
Plainview, New York from

Farmingdal Union Free
School District, Farming-
dale, New York to a point
where Plainview-Old Beth-

page Central School Dis-

trict, Plainview, New York,

Farmingdal Union Free

School District, Farming
dale, New York and Beth-

page Union Free School

District, Bethpage, New
York meet; thence in a gen-

erally northerly direction

along the boundary line
which divides Plainview-
Old Bethpage Central
School District, Plainview,

Ne York from Bethpag
Union Free School District,

Bethpag New York to the
center line of Plainview
Road, the poin of place of

beginnin
’ HARRIET FISCHER

District Clerk

P-4585-4T-5/6-PL
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Hicksvil
Suspicio Confirmed

Hicksville’s Lacrosse

team capabl of rainin
goa in six straigh wins but

observers were alarmed

concern defense.

League leader Farming-
dale twisted past Orang
defenders fo 1 goal in

commanding showdown,

145.
Jim Caddiga lea a rec-

overy. Tuesday, as Comets

defeated Port Washingto
11-7. Season record 7-2.

Jim Salera backed Caddi-

gan with two goals rich

DePalma, John Panchoo-

kian, Bill Dempsey, Mike

Magee Jim Magne and Joe

Denicola each scored one.

Joe Mistretta kep 1 Port

shots out of the nets.

Plainview District put up

a gam try but Chris Jordan

By Howard Finnegan

peppere four goal ina 15-

win.
Port Washington 22-7

Hicksville 5042-11

Hicksville Varsity team

recorded 6-4 win over Con-

ference One foe Farming-
dale. It was a follow up toa

7-1 win at Bellmore

Kennedy.

Anoop and Mohit Der-

jani stood fast ground
before bowing 5-7, 6-1, 6-4

in a doubles tennis match

again _Farmingdale The

triumph enabled the Dalers

to edg Hicksville 4-3.

Hicksville’s Bill Loscp
continues standout effort

for Kutztown State. He had

six assists in rout of East

Stroudsburg, 25-4.
John Rodney, winner

Sp Round-
outstandin football player
while at HHS, had involve-

men in Post College Div-

ision One 16-6 victor of

Notr Dame&# Lacrosse
tear.

It is reporte John is one

of many varsity athletes who

will be deprive of football

scholarships. Post has

announced droppin from

Division Two class and can-

cellin all gri scholarship
In the face of ridicule

from the only Daily New

York-Long Island, and
resulting lack of fan interest,
Post gave up its ambitious

pi skin program.

The term “lack of ink” for
Long Island sports teams.in
the one daily pres is the rea-

son th area ha lost eleven

major semi-pro or pro
teams.

Hicksvi Success Stor
Once a country boy and

now as a successful insu-

rance broker, Larry McCaf-

frey’s life has centered

around Broadway, Hicks-

ville. He grew up here as a

small town country boy and

today operates the McCaf-

frey- Insurance Agenc
located at 560 S. Broadway,
which he founded in 1950

Commenting o the dras-

tic change in his surround-

ings ‘Mc.Caffrey said “I

would very much hav liked

to have my kids grow u in
the Hicksville that grew up

in, but it would have been

quit impossibl to hav
started my business had it
not been for the major

growth.
Larry McCaffrey was

born in Hicksville on July
25, 1919. His father was

from County Cavan, Ire-

land: his mother a member

of the Peter Mayer farm

family, lived on Old Coun-

try Road where the Old

Country Road School now

stands. As a child with 4

brothers and sister, McCaf-

frey lived over the Ralston

Grocery store on the East

Side of Broadway and later

moved across the street

where his father owned a

deli. In the early 20&

Broadway was a plac of

small stores and the owner
and families lived upstairs.
Sausmers Hardware. Guck-

enberg Ice Cream Store,

Beatty’ Stationery, Kunz

Butcher sho helpe form a

close knit community. The

family later moved to Jerus-

alem Ave, at the corner of

Nicolai St, next doo to Pas-

tor Rusch of Trinity Luthe-

ran Church. “It was a beau-

tiful time, everybod knew

each other.” McCaffrey
recalls. “Whe I was drafted

into the army Leary Loeffl
told me my notice was in the

mail box”.
He has many vivid memo-

ries of his grammer school

days at St. Ignatius spen
in preciou penni at Re-

Pete Candy Store, toot-

bali & baseball game in the

Nicholi Street, lot, now

Trinity Lutheran Churc
He also recalls the Voight

By Rosemary Grant

Larry McCaffrey

Lumber Yard and Saw Mill,

across the street from St.

Ignatius “The girl school

yard was on the church side

and the boy was on the rail-

road side. No fightin was

allowed in the school yard
The boy settled their differ-

ences across the street,

behind Voight’s barn!”

O the Cherry Street side

the overflow from Frosts Ice

Plant created a huge cold

pon and the water running
along the railroad tracks

produce frogs which third

grad boy loved to brin to

school an let go. “I bet the

goo sisters knew almost to

the day when it would

happen and would have a

pretty goo guess who

would d it,” he said.

McCaffrey graduated
from Hicksville High
School in 1936 and com-

muted to

a

job in New York.

He was drafted into the

Army in World War II, serv-

in overseas. H is the recip
ient of the Purpl Heart.

After the War, he returned

to Hicksville, worked in

Ne York and walked over

the Brooklyn Bridg to

attend St. John’s University
graduatin in 1947 He

earned a CPCU degre in

insurance in 1950 and

started the insurance
agency.

ue

Married to Dorothy

Schultz from Ba Ridge,
Brooklyn and th father of 6

children and | grandchil
McCaffrey still found time

to be active in communit
affairs. He was a trustee of

the Hicksville School Board

in the 50’s during

a

period of -]

,

growt -4 grammer schools
and one hig school. The

Board purchas 20 acre

sites from Levitt to insure

ample room for sports activ-

ities for young peopl
Asa member of the Lion’s

McCaffrey held all the offi-

ces, including President.

Thru the Lions he partici
pate in sigh savin classes

to take vision impair
youngsters on trips to

Bronx, Zoo, Mitchell Field,

etc. Like many other subur-

ban dads, his children led

him into lots of coachin
assignme in baseball and

basketball.
|

McCaffrey is prou of a

(Continue on Pag 8)
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Hicksvill Baseball Association

Th Openin Day dedica-
tion of the memorial flag
pol for Al Greene and

Wally Collins was held last

Saturday, as scheduled,
even thoug it “POURED*.
However, HBA’s spirits

weren&#3 dampene as Linda

Strongin, 2nd Vice-

President & Co-ordinator of

Openin Day Ceremony,
introduced Congressman

Norman: Lent. He in turn

present Donna Rehman,

trustee for HBA, with an

American Fla accompan-
ied b

a

letter from the Pres-

ident of the U.S., Ronald

Reagan stating that it had

flown above the Capito
Building in Washington,
D.C., on February 16 1983.

A second flag was present
to the leagu b the Greene

family.
Mar Ellen Nealo led the

congregatio in singin the

“Star Spangle Banner”.

Tom Nealon, past HBA

president then spok of the

two men and how the gave
their time and efforts to our

youngsters. Girard Skaee,

past trustee, presente
plaque to their families to

commemorate this memor-

able occasion.
The Openin Praye was

led by Father Thomas

McCormick of Holy Family
R.C. Church. He asked

God& blessin for the chil-

dren and their families in the

comin baseball season. He

even put in a goo word to

grant us goo weather which

we sure do need. A moment

B Ann Macaluso

of silence was held in

memory of Tara Maloney.
Assemblyma Fred Par-

ola present the leagu
witha Proclamation from

the ‘State Assembly, and

Councilman Thomas Clark’

congratulated us on our

30th yea in little league and

said to “Keep up the goo
work.” They graciously

braved the bad weather to

get our season under way.
T.O.B. Clerk, Ann

Ocker, Richard Hogan,
A.D.. Charlene Anci, school

board presiden and Neil

McCormick, a goo friend

of HBA, arrived to support
our organizatio and throw

out the first ‘ball, even

though all games were can-

celled. HBA’s President, Bill
Rizzo, presented Mrs.

Ocker with a bouque of

flowers to show our appre-
ciation for her concern and

support of our youngsters.
He thanked the town offi-

cials and dignitarie for

coming to our Openin
Ceremony.

Seasonal Grand Openin
of our Refreshment Stand

thanks to the hard work of

Steve Strongin. Kee in

mind that volunteers are’

needed to work in the she
during the season. If you can

help pleas contact Mr.

Strongi at 822-8710.
Team photos and raffle

books: will be reschedul at a

later date
We have a total of 4

sponsors thanks to the per-
sistent efforts of our Vice-

Can’ D Bette

© UNIFOR © CARE APPA
DIREC SALE TO MUNICIPALITIE INDUSTRY,

SCHOOL HOSPITAL POLICE FIREFIGHT ETC.

¢ LICENSE POSTAL UNIFOR VENDO

© COMPLET EMBLE & LETTERIN

President, Bob Rothschild,
wh for the pas two years
has been in touch with our

local merchants and has

secured their financial help
Please patroniz the follow-

in sponsors who have made

this 1983 season possibl
Our sincer thanks an
appreciatio go to:

Abruzzo Interiors, Alad-

di Florist, Antuns Cater-

ing, Bi An Juice &
Drink Co., Red Quic
Print, Crown Gas, Dalton
Funeral Home, Discount

Liquors Empir Diner, F &
M Deli, Galileo Lodge
Goldman Brothers, Harbor

Distributors, Hicksville

Bike, Liberty Plumbin &

Heatin Co., Lions Club,

Long Island Trust, Malvese

& Co., Manufacturers Han-

over Trust, Meenan Oil,
Nat& Bank of North Amer

ica, Northern & 10 Old

Country Deli, Old Country
Toyota, Pennysaver Peters

Cleaners, RJC Distributors,
Roberts Chevrolet, Seaman

& Eisemann Ins.; Solomon

Insurance, Sound Move

Datsun, T.J. Courtneys,
The Dukes, The Dutchesses,
Trade Winds, Trapasso Tree

Care, Thrifty Beverages,
V.F.W. Post 3211 West Vil-

lag Carvel, Wagne Fun-

eral Home and Wickers
Restaurant.

Specia thanks to the

executive board of the HBA
for their year-round efforts

makin this 1983 season

possibl
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fla program started when

he was President of the

Chamber of Commerce in

1963. Donations were soli
cited, flag and brackets

‘were purchased, which
TO attached to meters on

Broadway. The Chamber o
Commerce owns the flags

stored in the Hicksville Fire

House. Eigh coummunity
organizati share the priv
ileg of putting the flag out

for specia parade and

events
2

McCaffrey also holds f
distinguished- of bein

the first preside of the

Long Island Chapter of

C.P.C.U., a very respected

insurance degree

The presen problem of

Broadway sometimes

LEGAL NOTIC
NOTICE O

.
ANNUAL DISTRICT

ELECTION
HICKSVILLE UNION

FREE SCHOOL
DISTRICT

HICKSVILLE,
©

—NEW YORK

*NOTICE IS HEREBY

GIVE that pursuant to the

resolution of the Board of

Education of Hicksville

Union Free School District.

Hicksville, New York,

adopt February 23, 1983,

the Annual District Election

of the qualifie voters of this

Schoo District will be held

on Wed., May 25, 1983,

_

between the hours of 10:00

o&#39;c A.M. (D.S.T.) and

10:00 o’clock P.M. (D.S.T.)
in the seven Election Dis-

tricts, stated below, for the

purpose of voting upon the

following proposition(s
- PROPOSITION NO. |

Shall the Budget ap-

prove b the Board o Edu-

cation pursuant to Section

1716, be approve anda tax

on the taxable property of

the District in the amount of

such Budget, less State and

Federal Aid and revenues

from other sources, be

levied?
PROPOSITION NO. 2

Shall the School District
..

Budge be increased b
_ approximately $84,000.00

to provid for anelementary
foreign languag program in

~ grade four through six on

the same basis and to the

same extent such a program
was provided in the school

year 1982-1983?
PROPOSITION NO.

Shall the School District

Budge be increased by
$84.000.00%0 provid for

guidanc Counsel serv-

ices in the elementar
schools of the District on the

same ’basis and to the same

extent such guidanc coun-

selling services were pro-
vided in the school year
1982-83?

NOTICE IS FURTHE
GIVEN that nominating

‘petition for the office of

«member of the Board of

Education must be filed|with

the Clerk of the School Dis-

trict no later than thirty (30

day before the Annual

Meeting, said date bein
Monday, April 25, |1983

‘between: the hours of 9:00

A.M. and 5:00 P.M: A

—__separate’ petition shall be

require to nominate a can-

plague McCaffrey. “When

Broadway was widene the

state took a level road and

pave the cast side about a

foot lower than the west

side!” He thinks store and

dwellings type Main Street

such, as Farmingdale and

Westbuy might help. There

is a need for some less

expensive type of housing
feels especial for peopl

who will not have autos so

that .
the

—

proximity to

stores and transportation
should be near those com-

bined mercantile and

apartment units. He favors

a&quot; realistic approac to

the use of the Broadway
properties.’’-and Larry

McCaffrey shoul know -

when it comes to Broad-

way.....he has been there for

a lifetime.

didate to each separate
office. Each petiti shall be

directed to the Clerk of the

School District, shall be

signe b at least 55 qual
fied voters of the District:

(the same being two percent
(2%) of the number of voters

who voted in the previou
Annual Meeting shall state

the residence of each signer,
the name an residence of

the candidate, and describe

the specifi vacancy for

whic the candidate is nom-

inated, which descriptio
shall include at least the

lengt of the term of the

office and name of the last

incumbent. Forms of peti-
tions for School Board

Members may be obtained

from the Clerk of the School

District.
The following vacancies

are to be filled on the Board

of Education: :

year term endin June

30th, 1986

Last Incumbent: Mrs.

Charlene Anci

year term ending June

30th, 1986
Last Incumbent: Daniel

E. Arena
NOTICE IS FURTHER

GIVE that Persona! Reg
istration and Election Dis-

.

tricts have been established

in the Schoo! District, that

no perso shall be entitled to

vote at the Annual District
Election whose name does

not appear on the register of

the School District, unless

such person is registere
under the provisions of Sec-

tion 352 of the Election Law

as amended b Chapter 629

of.th Laws of 1975, and that

those qualifie to register
and vote shall do so in the

School Election District in

which the reside.
NOTICE IS FURTHER

GIVEN that copie of the

statement of estimated

expenses for the school year
1983-1984 may be obtained

by any taxpayer in the Dis-

trict at each school house in

the District daily except
Saturday and Sunday on

and after May 18 1983.

between 9:00 A.M. to 4:00

P.M. and that any other

proposition to be voted

upon are available- for

inspectio b any taxpayer
in the District at each school

house in the District ‘daily
except Saturday and Sun-

day on and after May 18

1983. between 9:00 A.M.

The United Methodist

Women held their Annual

Fashion Show on Wednes-

day, April 6, at the United

Methodist Church on Old

Country Road and Nelson

Avenue in Hicksville. The

maximum number of tickets

which can b sold is 200 and

they were sold out weeks

before the show. This is one

of the “fun” evenings on the

UM calendar, the majority
of which are religio or in-

formative programs.

The men&#3 and women&#3

fashions this year were by
“Country Boutique’ on Nor-

thern Boulvard in East Nor-

wich. The mother-of-the

bride and bridal fashions

were by “The Bridal Shop”
on North Broadway in

Hicksville.

and 4:0 P.M.
___

NOTICE IS FURTHER

GIVE that a publi hear-

in shall be held on May II,

1983, at the Senior High
School for the purpose of

discussion of the expendi
ture of funds and the budget-
in thereof.

NOTICE IS FURTHER

GIVEN that the Board o
Registratio shall meet in
the seven (7 Election Dis-

tricts described below on:

Wednesda Ma 18 198

from 3 p.m, untii 8 p.m.
(D.S.T.)

Any person shall be

entitled to have his name

place upon such registe
provide that.at such meet-

in of the Board of Registra-
tion he proves to the satis-

faction of such Board of

Registratio to be then or

thereafter entitled to vote at

the school meetin or elec-

tion for which such register
i prepare Said registe
will be filed in the office of

the Clerk of the District on

May 18 1983, and will be

open for inspectio by any

qualified voter of the Dis-

trict from 9:00 A.M. to 4:00

P.M. onany week da from

Ma 19 1983 up to and

including May 25 1983.

Residents who voted at an

Annual or Speci Meeting
of the District within four

years from the date of the

current (Annual) (Specia
Meeting, or who registere
within that time need not

registe to be eligibl to vote

at the (Annual) (Special
Meeting Residents other-

wise qualified to vote who

are registere under the pro-
visions of Section 352 of the

Election Law as amended by
Chapter 629 of the Laws of

1975 need not register to be

eligible to vote at the

Meeting
NOTICE IS FURTHER

GIVEN that during the vot-

in hours on May 25, 1983
the Board of Registration
will meet in the various élec-

tion districts to receive regis
tration for the ensuin year.

SCHOO ELECTION
DISTRICTS

The boundaries of the

school election districts, as

adopte b resolution of the

Board of Education and the

plac in each electio district
for registration and voting
shall be as follows: :

Election District No.

Burns Avenue School

Donna Villazon as the

“bride” in the recent fashion

show.

On the East: Broadway;
from the District&# North

Line, to the intersection Jer-

usalem Avenue and Broad-

way, continuing South:

along Jerusalem Avenue to

the intersection of Jerusa-
lem Avenue and the Long
Island Railroad.

On the South: The Long

Islan Railroad, from Jer-

usalem Avenue to the Dis-
trict’s West line.

On the West: The Dis-
trict’s West line from the

One of the lovely dresses

modeled by Nancy

Weisgerber.

Columbia Road.
On the South and West:

Columbia Road, from the

District’s East line, Wes to

Berkshire Road, then West

along Berkshire Road into.

Haverford Road, and con-.

tinuing West on Haverford
Road to Dartmouth Drive

then North and Northeast

along Dartmouth Drive to

Ardsle Gate; then North-

west through Ardsle Gate

to Woodbury Road, then

Southwest along Woodbury
Long Island Railroad tothe Ro to Ronald Avenue,

District’s North Line.”
O the-North: Th Dis-

trict’s N line from the

District& West line to

Broadway.

Electi District No. 2

t

a he East and North,
Milér Roa as projecte to

District’s North line,
uth alon said Miller

oad to Ronald Avenue,
th East alon Ronald

Averiue to Woodbury Road,
then Northeast along
Woodbury Roa to Ardsley
Gate, then Southeast

through Ardsley Gate to

Dartmouth Drive, then

Southwest and South

through Dartmouth Drive

to its intersection with

Haverford Road, then East

to the intersection of Haver-

ford Road and Berkshire

Road, then East along Berk-

shire Roa to its intersection
with Columbia Road.

then East alon Columbia
Road to the District’s East

line, then South along the

District’s East line to the

Long Island Railroad.
On the South and

Southwest, along the Lon
Island Railroad, from the

District’s East line southerly
point, to the intersection of

the Long Island Railroad

and Jerusalem Avenue.

On the West: Broadway
from Jerusalem Avenue to

the District&# North line.
On the North: the Dis-

trict’s North line from

Broadway to Miller Road,

as projecte to sai line.

Election District No.

W ue Schoo
On the North, Northeast

and East alon the District’s
North line, from Miller

Road, as projecte to the

District’s North line, to the

District&# East line.
On the East: South along

the District&#3 East line, from

the District&#3 North line, to

en West along Ronald

Avenue to Miller Road,
then North along Miller

Road and continuing there-,
on as it i projected, to the

District’s North line.

_

Election District No. 4
. Schoo
On the East-Northeast,

the Long Island Railroad,
from its intersection with

Old Country Road, to the

Southerly poin of the Dis-

trict’s Eas line.
On the South, the Dis-

trict’s South line, from the

Long Island Railroad,

Southwesterly into Michi-

gan Drive, then Southalong
said District line to the

Hempstea Township line,
then Northwesterl along
the District’s South line to

Jerusalem Avenue.
On the West and North,

along Jerusalem Avenue,

from the District&#3 South

line. to Salem Gate, then

West along Salem Gate to

Salem Road, then North to

Harkin Lane, then Northw-

est along Harkin Lane to

Division Avenue, then

North along Division

Avenue to Glenbrook Road,
then Northwest alon Glen-

brook Road to Newbridge
Road, then Northwest along
Newbridge Road to Old

Country Road, then East

alon Old Country Road to

the Lon Island Railroad.
Election District No.

Fork Lane School

On the East: Jerusalem
- Avenue from Salem Gate, to

the District’s Sout line.
On the North: Salem

Gate, West from Jerusalem
Avenue, to Salem Road,
then North alon Salem
Road to Harkin Lane, then

Northwest along Harkin
Lane to Division Avenue,
then Northwesterly along
Division Avenue to Glen-

brook Road then West

along Glenbrook Road to

Richard Wicks

sports clothes at the fashion

show.

models

Newbridge Road.

On the West: Newbridg
Road, from Glenbrook

Road on the North, to the

District&# South Line.

On the South: the Dis-

trict’s South Line, from

Newbridge Road, on the

West, to Jerusalem Avenue

on the East.
Election District No. 6

On the East: Newbridg
Road, from Elmira Street,

to the District’s South line.

On the South, the Dis-

trict’s South line, from

Newbridg Road, on the

East, to the District&# West

line.
On the West: the District’s

West line, from the District&#3

South line to Arrow Lane,

as said Lane is projecte
West to the District’s West

line.
On the North: from

Arrow Lane, ‘as projecte to

the District&# West line, East

and along said Arrow Lane,
to Levittown Parkway, then

South along Levittown

Parkway to Beech Lane,

then East along Beech Lane

to Blueberry Lane, then

South along Blueberry Lane

to Elmira Street, then East

along Elmira Street to New-

bridg Road.
Election District No. 7

School
On the North and North-

east: the Long Island Rail-

road from the District&#

West line to the intersection
of the Railroad with Old

Country Road.

On the South and East:

Old Country Road from its

intersectio with the Long
Island Railroad, Westerly to -

Newbridge Road, then
Southwest along Newbridg

Roa to Elmira Street. then

West along Elmira Street to

Blue Lane, the North

along Blueberr Lane to

Beech Lane, then West

along Beech Lane to Levit-

town Parkway, then North

along Levittown Parkway to

Arrow Lane, then West

along Arrow Lane, and as

projecte to the District&#
West line.

BY ORDER OF THE
BOARD OF EDUCATION

Hicksville Union Free
School District

Hicksvill Town of

Oyste Bay, N.Y.
Jane A. Wilder

District Clerk
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Adult Learni Experi ,

A free county-wide con-

ference co- b the

Nassau Association for

Continuing/Community
Education (NACCE) and

the Lon Island Association

for Commerce and Industry
and directed at educators

and member of the business

communit concerned with

life-long learning will be

held at Roslyn High School.

Round Hill Road, Roslyn
Heights on Saturday, April
23, from 8:30.am to pm.

The conference will focus

on the linkag of education

This week marks the end

of National Library Week.

W would like to remind our

patrons that the following
programs will b presente
Friday, April 22nd at 8:00

Hearin Date Chang
The Town of Oyster Bay

Hearing Date on the proper-

ty located on South Oyster
Bay Rd. and Garden St.

Hicksville, has been change
from April 26th to Jurte 7th.

Richar Burk
(Cont& from Plainview P 1

exercise independent
judgement, he must do so in

the context of hi or her

responsibiliti to the peopl
who have elected him or her.

will kee am oper mind,

and will lend a responsiv
ear to all ideas and

opinions.”
~The most effective way

to preserve and maintain

our-educational facilities i

preventive, maiatenance,
upkeep. and rehabilitation.
We must take positiv steps

to protect th capital
investment of District tax-

payers, With this aim in

mind. will work for a lon
range. comprehensi pro-

gram for buildings and

ground maintenance.” he

concluded.

LEGAL NOTICE

(Continued from Page 5)

and interest on such bonds

as the same respectivel
become due and payabl
There shall annually be

assessed upo all the taxable

real property in said Town

of Oyste Ba Public Light-
ing District at the same time

and in the same manner as

other town charges an

amount sufficient to pay
said principa and interest as

the same become due and

payable but if not pai from

such source, all the taxable

real property within said

Town shall be subje to the

levy of ad valorem taxes

without limitation as to rate

or amount sufficient to pay
the principa of and interest

on said bonds.

Sectio 5 Subjec to the

provisio of the Local

Finance Law, the power to

authorize the issuance. of

and to sell bon anticipation
notes in anticipation of the

issuance and sale of the

serial bonds herein autho-

rized, including renewals of

such notes, is hereb dele-

gate to the Superviso the

chief fiscal officer. Such

notes shall be of such terms,

form and contents, and shall

be sold in such manner, as

may be prescrib by said

Supervisor, consistent with

with business and industry
to serve the needs of the

adult learner in today’
societ Action labs, work-

shops and a variet of

exhibits showin materials,

developments, and proce-
dure in th field of continu-

in educatio will be part of

the day’ activities under the

general theme ‘Nassau

County--Gateway for Adult

Learning: A Great Place to

Learn and Earn.”

Participant in the con-

ference will be listed in a

teache directory distributed

Messag From O Library.
PM, a British film,
“Nicholas Nickelby” Satur-

day, April 23rd at 4:00 PM, a

Slide/Talk Show, ‘Famous

Long Island Residents and
Their Homes” presente by
the N.Y. Telephon Co.

The Hicksville Public

Library Board of Trustees,
Director and Staff would like

to take this opportuni to

thank all of the residents

who voted to approve the

Budge for 1983-84. *

Galile Lodg
(Continue from Page 11)

afternoon, the 15th of May,
starting at 2:30 P.M. Please

note that Mary Monteforte

(938-9536) will be selling
tickets costin $1 per per-

son, A Buffet Dessert will

also enhance the pro-

ceedings. The name of the

play is ‘SAME TIME NEXT

YEAR’.
« .* *

.

Very happ to report that

19’new members were sworn

in as members of the Galileo _

Lodge. We welcome them

aboard and we fervently

hop that the will take an

active part in the activities

of the Galileo Lodge The

Galileo Lodg needs your

help and loyalty if it is to

maintain its excellence.

LEGAL NOTICE

the provisions of the Local

Finance Law. ~

Section 6. Th validity of

such bonds and bond antici-

patio notes may be con-

tested onl if:
1 Such obligation are

authorized for an objec or

purpose for which said

Town is not authorized to

expen money, or

2 The provisio of law

which should be complie
with at the date of publica-
tion of this resolution are

not substantially complied
with,
and an action, suit or pro-
ceeding contesting such

validity: is commenced
within twenty day after the

date of such publication or

3 Such obligation ‘are

authorized in violation of

the provisions of the

Constitution.

Sectio 7. This resoslu-

tion, whic takes effect

immediately shall be pub
lished in full in Oyste Ba
Enterprise Pilot, Locust

Valley Leader, Massapequa
Observer & Mid Island

Herald, togethe with a

notice of the Town Clerk in

substantiall the form pro-
vided in Section 81.00 of the

Local Finance Law.
M4615-1T-4/22 MID

to NACCE members and

used as an employment
resource.

NACC is a professio
organizatio comprise of

over sixty membe institu-
tions representi publi
schools, college and oth
educational organizati in.

Nassau County providin
Continuing Education pro-

grams to meet the needs of

the adult community.

Law An Ord Nigh
The Hicksville Lodge

#1931 of the Benvolent and

Protective order of Elks will

hold a “Law and Order”

nigh on Monday, May 2 at

8 p.m. at the Elks Lodg
located at 80 E. Barcla St.,
Hicksville. On this night
those policeme of the

Second Precinct who per-
formed meritorious service

iri the community will be

honored.
This i a sequ to the

Michae Smit (cont& from Plainview Py1)

Tufts University, is.a’career

manager for the City of New

York. For the last five years
he ha served in the Division
of Speci Education of the

New York City Public
Schools. Currently he i

Assistant Administrator of

Manageme for the Bronx

and prior to that was Direc-

tor of Personnel for Speci
Education. He previousl

taught for five years and

from 1968-71 was on the

facult of Hofstra University
Mr. Smith i makin an

effort to reach all elements

in the communit -- parents,
students, teachers, adminis-

trators, the PTAs, School

Board members, and non-

parent taxpayers. He has

met or arranged meeting
with most of these groups
and is available to meet with

anyone in the communit
The campaig Mr. Smith

will be running will focus on

two maj issues:
© The need to better plan

for the future needs of the

district, particularl for the

use and maintenance of the
school buildings and

grounds. The district has

long ignore basic upkeep
and maintenance and even-

tually will face maj capital
expenditur without better

plannin
e A need to bring new,

young, involved peopl to

the School Board. Mr.

Smith will have children in

the schools until 1998 and

wants to guarantee his ch

ildren the same fine educa-

tion which has bee offered

children in this district in the

“Firemen’s” night, which

was observed on March 28,
and firemen who perform
outstanding service in the

Some people have strong
views on this question and

these ‘should be respected
Others have no firm com-

mitment one way or the

other, and would answer
such a questio on the

basis of circumstances. For

these people, we would of-

fer the following advice,
based on many years of ex-

perience

If the body can be made

viewable, it should be viewed -

It serves a number of very

helpful and constructive pur-

fined to a distant medical

institution, viewing can

provide the confirmation
that death hes occurred,

Somethin T
ee

BILL WAGN

holpful an conetructive Pe,
VERN C. WAGNER

Gecedent. hes been living FUNERAL HOM INC.
away from home, OF: con

«a4, Service Speak Fo Itself”

community were honored.
The public is invited to

atten “Law and Order”
night i

DIRECTOR

It provide a way, to recall

the loved one as he or she
should be remembered —

free of evidence of pain,
wasting, ar injury. Viewing
is likewise considered thera-

peutic for people. It is es-

pecially helpful for a child
the

BG6b &# Wdy “Aeplag — aivu3H M3IANIV1d/GNY 1SI GI — 6 98eq

of relying on’ imagination,
the child can begin to com-

prehend the real meaning of
death.

Tel: 935-7100
125 Old Country Rd.,
Cor. Jerusale Ave.,

Hicksville, N.Y.

past.
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LEGAL NOTICE

NOTICE OF
-PUBLIC HEARING

BY THE BOARD
OF ZONING APPEALS

Pursuant to the provision
of Article 12 Section Z-3.0.

of the Building Zone

Ordinance, NOTICE) is

hereby giy-
en that the BOARD OF

ZONING APPEALS of the

Town of&lt;=Hemps will

hold publi hearin in the

Town Meeting Pavilion,
Town Hall Plaza, Main

Street, Hempstead, New

¥ork on May 11 198 at

9:30 A.M., 10:00 A.M: &

2:00 P.M. to consider the

following application an
appeal
THE FOLLOWING CASES

WILL BE CALLED AT

5:30AM.
290. LAKEVIEW - Mar
Lizzie James, maintain two

family dwelling, 506

Champlai Ave.
291. BALDWIN - Eliecer

Torres, maintaintwo family apartment (dentist not

dwelling 607 Fairview Ave.

292, BELLMORE - John
residin on premise N/s
Broadway 80.01 ft. W/o

Ranieri, maintain two Lafayett Pl.

family dwelling 114 Linden

St.
293. ELMONT - Calogero
& Josephine Grisafi,

298. ROOSEVELT - Jay
Dee Tomfor Transportatio
Inc., maintain use of

premis for parkin school

maintain two family buses, omnibuses & carryall

dwelling 16 Claridge Ave.

294. ROOSEVELT - KBW

Realty Corp., maintain two

family dwelling N/E cor.

Debevois Ave. & Charles

St.

295. WOODMERE - Ber-

tram & Ann Moreida,

wagons, S/s Debevoise Ave.

439.70 ft. W/o Nassau Rd.

299. WEST HEMPSTEAD
-Kenneth & Gladys

Vreeland, maintain two

family dwelling, 23

Sycamor St.

TH FOLLOWING cas
maintain variance in off- WILL BE CAL
street parking & permissio
to park in front setback 300 NR. VALLEY STREAM-

area, N/s Broadway 80.01

ft. W/o Lafayett Pl.
HIT Construction Corp.,
variances, lot area, front

296. WOODMERE - Ber- width, subdivision of lot,

tram & Ann Moreida,
maintain permissio to par

in “CA™ zone for non-

resident adjacent owner,

‘N/s Broadway 80.01 ft. W/0
Lafayette PI.
297. WOODMERE - Ber-

tram & Ann Moreida,
maintain dentist office &

S

construct dwellin w/ garage,

S/s Decker St. 11 ft. E/o
Rockaway Pkway.
301 NR. VALLEYSTREAM-
HIT Construction Corp.,
variances, lot area, front

width, subdivision of lot,
maintain dwelling, S/s
Decker St. 155.7 ft. E/o

rockaway Pkway.
302. OCEANSID Michael

-J. @° Frances Falco,

variances, front yard
average setback, lot area,

front width, lot area

occupie subdivision of lot,

maintain dwelling, side &

rear yards, maintain
detached garage, W/s

Roxbury Rd. 120 ft. N/o
Campb Ave.

303 OCEANSID -Salvatore-

& Rosaria Gattuso,

variances, front yard
average setback, lot area,

front ‘width, lot area

occupie subdivision of lot,
maintain dwelling, side &

rear yards, maintain
detached garage, W/s
Roxbury Rd. 160 Ft. N/o
Campbe Ave.

304, LEVITTOWN - Terra

Homes, Inc., variances, lot

area, subdivision of lot,

construct 2-family dwelling
w/2-car attached garage,

S/W cor. Schoolhouse Rd.

& Division Ave.

305. LEVITTOWN - Terra

Hom Inc., variances, lot

mre

area, subdivision of lot °

construct 2-family dwelling
w/2 car attach garage,

“W/s. Division, Ave. 10 ft
S/o Schoolhouse Rd.

306. MERRICK - Cure’ of

Ars R.C. Church, erect 10.ft.

chain link fence, E/s
Merrick Ave. 7 ft. N/o
Kirkwood Ave.

307-308. BELLMORE -

Robert J. & Marie Stiles.

Use part of dwellin fo sale

& preparatio of plant &

flowers (Res “B” zone)
Waive off-street parkin
E/s Bellmore Ave. 78.0 ft.

N/o Bristol Dr.

H FOLLOWIN CASES

WILL B CALL

PM:
-

309. ATLANTIC BEAC -

Clive & Bonnie Chajet
install swimming poo in

front yard N/E cor. Oneida
Ave. & Ocean Blvd.

310-311. WANTAGH -

Michael & Geraldine

Dunphy Variances, front

yard setbacks, convert

building to restaurant

w/office above, construct I-

a lL

story addition. Variance in

off-street parking S/W cor.

Grove St. & Railroad Ave.

312-313;;ROQSEV -

Economic Opportunity
Commission of Nassau

County, Inc. Waive off-

street parking (enlarging
floor area of CAP offi
Permissio to park in Res.

“BY zone. S/E cor.

Hempstead- Tpke
& Monroe Ave.

314. NR. BETHPAGE _
Richard A. & Laura R Betz,

side yar variance, maintain

storage room, S/E cor.

Dianne St. & Windsor Dr.

315. SO. HEMPSTEAD -

Philip A..&am Elaine M.

Bruno, front yar average
setback variance, construct

addition, N/s Chester St.

380 ft. W/o Webber Ave.

Interested -parti “should

appea at the above time and

plac B order of the Board

of Zoning Appeals
Henry W. Rose Chairman

Ed Sutherland, Secretar

(A21) SP

Herald &

Tribunes

WE

1-100
Beacons

Iv 3-410

ALTERATIONS
; y lean- - Rubbish Removal: FUEL HELP WANTE HOM IMPROVEMEN MORTGAGE LOANS

“all nationally known

DRESSMAKING
ALTERATIONS

Experts on Tailoring, Pant

Suits, Coats, Dresses,
Wedding Gowns —

Custom Made

1W6-1148

ALUMINUM SIDING

ALUMINUM SIDING

BY 4

MASTER HOME
DEAL DIRECT

NO SALESMAN
FOR FREE EST. CALL

V 5-4639 1 5-237T

Eve.

“BUSIN OPPO

Own your own Jean-

Sportswear, Infant-
Preteen or Ladies

Appar Store. Offering

brands such as Jordache,

Chic, Lee, Levi, Vander-

bilt, Calvin Klein,

Wrangle over 200 othe
brands. $7,900 to $24,500

includes beginning
inventory, airfare for one

to Fashion Center,

training fixtures, gran
openimeyp motio
Call’ Mr.Kostecky (5
327-8031

|

CHILD CARE

Mother to care for child-

ren in her home. Da’s,-
nights week-ends. ‘Call

- 92127218. (c)

CHIMNEY

ARBOR “CHIMNEY

e All types chimney
cleaning and repairs.
e Professional analys of

chimne problems.
e Gutters and leaders

cleaned. 1

e Chimne relined.

Safet reports.
Lic and insured. 922-

Garages houses. yards.
lots, etc. Free estimates.

Bungert Landscaping
433-4335 and 433-6594.
(2 4-25

JOHN F. WOITOVICH
“Master Electrician,
Licensed, Bonded and

Insured. License #589

NH Call (516 796-3811.

(c)
.

————

Extermination & Tree Svc.

PHILIP HEALE
~-Complete

TREE SERVICE
@PruningeRemov

Lic. and Insured

798-0155

KEROSENE
Reasonabl price

Containers available.

Mon-Sat 9 am-5 pm
At our Terminal.

RELIANCE
UTILITIES

BE YOUR OWN BOSS!

Work from home, no

experienc Over $500

per week plu possibl
No sales require Call

312-920-9725 Ext.

H3192.

477 W. John St.. Hicks-

ville (across from Canti-

ague Park)
931-6800

HELP WANTED 8

INTERNATIONAL
OIL DRILLERS Now

hiring for roughneck
and some field staff.

Must train. $20,000 plus
For Information call

NEW OPENINGS for

National - Wide Indus-

tries. No sales, will train.

F&am
Construction Co.

Concrete Walks, Drives
and Patios

Free Estimates

General Contractors

Day (516 665.5366
Eve (51 523-1495

$15,000 + a year. For

information call 1-312

931-7051 ext. 31924.

EAST MEADOW &

VICINITY REAL EST-

ATE RENTALS - Sev

eral rental associates

needed. Experien pre-
ferred. Will train right
persons, Call Ed Keusey

747-1300(312 920-9675 Ext. 3192

B.

ARBOR Extermination
and Spray Service, Pro-

fessional pes control.

Termite control special
ists. Complet tree spray-

in programs. 922-1132.

FLOOR SCRAPING
a

FLOOR SCRAPING
and refinishing. New

floors installed. Floor

waxing service. Bus Bee

Lic. No. H1501210000
WE &amp;-5

——

FO SA

SACRIFICE
MUST SELL

Queen ‘size modern bed-

room set, Dinette, bar,

carpeting. Custom made,

like new. Call evening &

weekends. 486-1587.

Best offer.

198 Honda CR 250

Motocross, goo condi-

tion, sacrifice $750. 921-

2996. (eves.) (c)

197 Chev Monte Carlo

Landau top, white/red,

clean, 2500, eves, 921-2996.

1132 (c) (c)

AMFICO (The Ameri-

can Fidelity Co.) is in the

process of openin offi-

ces in this area. We need

between 12 and 15

peopl to work for us,

either part or full time.
WE ARE AN EQUAL
OPPORTUNITY EM-

PLOYER. Your: work

will consist of sendin
out free Advertising
Sample and/or Bro-

chures to those request-
ing them and up-
local mailing lists. You

will receive $250 to $500

weekl paychec (FULLY
GUARANTEED). Your

weekl paychec will b

mailed directly to you b
computer from our. Cen-

tral Home Office. Start

immediately No expe-
rience: required. Full

details and Applicatio
Form sent free of charge.
Write to: AMFICO(Hir-
ing Dept, 77) 1040 Lone

Star Dr., New Braunfels,

TX. 78130.

.

The Syoss School Dis
,

trict i in need of Substi-

tute Lunch Aides and

Substitute Typis Clerks.

Call 921-5500 ext. 219.

(4/22-6/ 10

NEEDLECRAFT repre-
sentative wanted, full-

time or part time. Earn

high commission. Teach

and Demonstrate qualit
needlecraft - Call

516-378-8028.

HOME IMPROVEMENTS

HOME SERVICE

Repa service, alt@ra+

tions, cesspool bath-

room remodeling, save!--

solar-hot -water, custom

vanitie all work guaran-
teed. Botto Bros. Plumb-

ing & Weatin Contrac-

tors. Inc., Showroom.

12 Woodbury Rd..

Hicksville 935-2900.
.

CLEANUPS, Yards,
Basements, ‘attics, gar-

ages. Rubbish removed -

‘Light trucking - refriger
ators, stoves, etc. Free
Estimates WE 1-8190.

LANDSCAPI

HO
MORTGA
LY POIN

Conventional 30-Yr

fixed rate for owner

occupied houses.

Credit, interview &

closing locally. Also

Refinancing available.

CAROLD CORP.

E Woft 212-434-0

PLUMBING

FRANK V.

PANZARINO
Licensed Plumbing Heating

Gas Conversions

_

(Your Local Plumber)

447 JERUSALEM AVE.

UNIONDALE
Sewers Cleaned Electrically «

IV 9-6110
Plumbing.and Heating

Supplies for the Homeowner

ALCOA ALUMINUM

‘Siding at mechanic& pri
ces. White aluminum

gutters, leaders. New

roofs, repairs caulking
Lic .W3301250000.

i\Lofaro. CH 9-354],

Free landscapin esti-

mates for °8 season.

Must call now for 10
discount. Free gif for

work taken. Bungert
Landscaping, 433-4335
and 433-6594, (2/4-25

PLANE & FANCY

General Contrctors.

Carpentry, Kitchens

(New & Refaced) Base-

ments & Bathrooms,

Replacement windows,

Doors, Painting. 516--

538-2273.

Concrete Walks, Drives,
:

Patios

Free Estimates

F & G Co

Sprin Clean- Lawn

Maintenance. Call John

a

TAG SALE
———

April 30 9 a.m.&#39; Lee

Court. West Hempstea
across from Echo Park.

Two lovely old bed-

rooms,

&#39;

living room,

dinette, electric kitchen

921-2996. (c)

MISC. FOR SAL

CARS $100! TRUCKS
$75! Available at local -

gov sale Call (refund-
able 312-931-533 Ext.

3192B for your directory
on ho to purchas

tion Co.

Days 665-5176
Eves 623-1496

JOHN J. FREY Asso-

ciates. One of Long
Island& larges alumi-

num siding and roofing
contractors. Lic.-

H3302000000.. Fre esti-

_mates 922-0797.
.

WINDOW SHADES

PAL SHAD
Discounts on

Woven Woods, Vercital -

Blinds, Window Shades

Riviera Blinds
249-1172

appliance brasschande-
lier, Singer: sewing
machine, electric drill,
housefull of collectibles.

eit

eesennsterecenieemtto

TENDER LOVING

TAG SALE

-

If you must

sell the contents of your

dwelling, we will come

into your home and

appraise price advertise,
set up and conduct your

tag sale for you “With a

loving touch.” Call any
time 516-354-7089.

W OOD FOR SALE

Cord wood. $140.00 a

cor Call John 921-2996.
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Galile Lod News
By Joe Lorenzo

MESSAGE FROM ficers and members. The of- retarded childr disaster

VENERABLE SKIP ficers of our Lodg must be drives, Little Leagues and

MONTEFORTE TO ALL commended highly for their many other charitable

MEMBERS OF THE

GALILEO LODGE AND

THE LADIES AUXILIARY:
“1 would like to take this

wonderful opportunity

|

to

thank all my brothers and

sisters for supportin me as

Venerable of the Galileo

Lodg this pas year. It has

been a goo year for me as

well as for the Lodg Many
things were accomplishe
We have support many
charities from Little League

to the Gift of Sight We are

involved, and still are, in

many other community-
oriented affairs and in help
ing the needy Bu all these

well-intentioned charitable

acts could not have occurred
if it were not for the coopera-

tion and devotion of our of-

LEGAL NOTICE

NOTICE IS HEREBY

GIVE that the resolution

publishe herewith has been

adopte b the Town Board

of the Town of Oyste Bay,
Nassau County, New York,

on April 12 1983 and the

validity of the obligations
authorized b such resolu-

tion may be hereafter con-

tested only if such obliga
tions were authorized for an

objec or purpose for which

said Town is not authorized

to expen money, o if the

provision of law which

should have been complie
with as of the date of publi
cation of this notice were not

substantially complie with,

and an action, suit or pro-
ceeding contesting such

validity is commenced
within twenty day after the

da of publicatio of this

notice, or such obligations
were authorized in violation

of the provision of the

Constitution.
Dated: Oyste Bay,
New York

April 12 198
ANN R. OCKER

Town Clerk
RESOLUTION

:

NO. 358A -1983

BOND RESOLUTION
DATE April 12 1983

A RESOLUTION AUTH-
ORIZING THE ISSU-

ANCE OF $488,000
SERIAL BONDS OF THE

TOW OF OYSTE BAY,
NASSAU COUNTY, NEW

YORK, TO PAY THE

COST OF THE INCREASE
AND IMPROVEMENT

OF THE FACILITIES OF

THE SYOSSET WOOD-

BURY COMMUNITY
PARK DISTRICT IN

SAID TOWN.
WHEREAS, pursuant to

proceedin heretofore had

and taken, and more partic
ularly an order dated March

22 1983 the Town Boar of

the Town of Oyster Bay,
Nassau County, New York,
has determined it to be in the

publi interest to increase

and improv the facilities of

the Syoss Woodbury
Community Park District in

said Town, consisting of the

construction of a sanitary
sewer connection to perm

sanitar sewag facilities to

b provide to said Syoss
Woodbury Community

concern and in their efforts

to make it possibl for the

Galileo Lodg to envision

one of its best years. This

condition, of course, put us

in a prou positio to do

more for th needy the poor
and the community-at-large.

“Now that I have started

my new ter in office, I ap-

‘pea to all officers and

members to come forward

once agai and ge involved

so that we may agai see a

very prosperous year. There

are many other problem to

be solved and there are

many things that we can and

must look forward to. We

must work very hard for our

Blood Program, Gift of

Sight Gift of Life, March of

_Dimes, parties for the

LEGAL NOTICE

Park District; and

WHEREAS, it is now

desired to authorize such

increase and improvemen
of facilities and to provid
for the financing thereof;
NOW, THEREFORE, BE

IT
RESOLVED, by the

Town Board of the Town of

Oyste Bay, Nassau County,
Ne York, as follows:

Secti |, The specifi
object or purpose to be

financed pursuant to this

resolution is the increase

and improvement of the

facilities of the Syosse
Woodbury Community

.Park District of the Town of

Oyster Bay, Nassau County,
New York, consisting of the

construction of a sanitar
sewer connection to permi

sanitary sewage facilities to

be provide to said Syoss
Woodbury Community

Park District in said Town.

Sectio 2. The:maximum
estimated cost of such spe-
cific objec or purpose is

$488,000, and the pla for

the financing thereof is by
the issuance of $488,000
serial bonds of said Town,
hereb authorized to be

issued pursuant to the Local

Finance Law. Further

details pertaini to said
bonds will be prescribe ina

further&#39;resolu or resolu-

tions of this Town Board.

Section_3 It i hereb
determined that the perio
of probabl usefulnes of the

aforesaid specifi objec or

purpos is fifteen years, pur-
suant to subdivision 19(c of

paragra

a

of Section 11.00

of the Local Finance Law. It

is hereb further determined
that the maximum maturit
of the serial bonds herein

authorized will exceed five

years.
Section.

4,

The faith and

credit of said Town of Oys
ter Bay, Nassau County,
Ne York, are hereb irre-
vocably pledg for the

payment of the princip of

and interest on such bond
as the same respectiv
become due and payabl
There shall annually be

assesse upo all the taxable

real property in said Syoss
Woodbury Community

Park District at the same

time and in the same manner

causes. Our concerted ef-

forts, vigilance and devotion
will prove very rewarding
fo all of us. We have alread
started our basement and
recreational area renovation

program complete with

sauna and exercise room,

fishing trips, gol outings
and family picnics at

Eisenhower Park. Our

members must also be

rewarded, of course.

“Qur ith Annivers
and Scholarshi Dance has

all the earmarks of being
very successful this year and

our slate of new officers are

working hard alon with me

to bring all these aspiration
and goal to fruition. And, of

course, our membership
must also pick up the reins

LEGAL NOTICE

as other Town charge an

amount sufficient to pay
. said princip and interest as

the same become due and

payabl but if not pai from

such source, all the taxable

real property within said

Town shall be subjec to the

lev of ad valorem taxes

without limitation as to rate

or amount sufficient to pay
the principa of and interest

o said bonds.
ecti

,
Subjec to the

provision of the Local

Finance Law, the power to

authorize the issuance of

and to sell bond anticipatio
notes in anticipatio of the

issuance and sale of the

serial bonds herein autho-

rized, including renewals of

such notes, is hereb dele-

gate to the Supervisor, the

chief fiscal offi Such

notes shall be of such terms,

form and contents, and shall

be sold in such manner, as

may be prescrib b said

Superviso consistent with

the provision of the Local

Finance Law.

Section 6,
The validity of

such bonds and bond antici-

patio notes may be con-

tested onl if:
1 Such obligation are

authorized for an objec or

purpose for which said

Town i not authorized to

expen money, or

2 The provision of law

which should be-
with at the date of publica
tion of this resolution are

not substantiall complie
with,
and a action, suit or pro-
ceeding contesting such

validity is commenced
within twenty da after the

date of such publicatio or

3 Such obligation are

authorize in violation of

the provisions of the

Constitution. .

Section_7._ resolu-

tion, which takes effect

immediately, shall be pub-
lished in full in Oyster Ba
Enterprise Pilot, Locust

Valley Leader, Massapequ
Obser Mid Island

Heraldggtogeth with a

notice e Town Clerk in

substahitfall the form pro-
vided in Section 81.00 of the

Local Finance Law.

M-4617-1T 4/22 MID

and work right alon with us.

Success can only be based on

many hours of toil and

sacrifice, but it is for our

own cause. Please ge in-

volved with us, hel us in any

way you can. Come to the

meetings, be heard, express

your thought and ideas.

Remember, we are elected

by you, the membership and

we will do everythin in our

power to make all members

prou of us and our organiza
tion.

“Be prou to be a member

of the Galileo Lodg and, in

turn, you will be prou to be

a member of the Orde of the

Sons of Italy in America. Be

proud to belong to an

organizatio that does not

onl exist for itself but for

mankind as well.”
2 *

Activities not to be forgot
ten or overlooked b our

trons and friends are: the

jith Anniversary Dinner-

Dance and Scholarship
Awards, scheduled for

Saturday, the 30th of April.
Contact Chairman Joe Gior-

dano (333-4555), co-

Chairman Pete Massiello

(838-433 and Joe Morace

(931-254 for ticket sales

and information. Then on

Saturday, the 2ist of May,

Ianotti looks on approving
This award was presente at the St. Josep Dance held in

March.

the Ladies Auxiliary, under

the supervisio of Mary
Monteforte (939-9536 will

presen its May Dance. Also

assisting are co-
Rose Riccardi (681-0960 and

Marion Fried (931-9351),

both of whom are now selling
tickets. Millie Del Ciopp is

decorations.
Kindly be informed that

Sue Laurenti of the Ladies

Auxiliary is no longer
associate with the physic
fitness classes but she is

now in charge of the 198

‘Foolies Follies’ producti
scheduled for Autumn.

Photo shows Venerable Ski Monteforte (left) presenti a

meritorious award plaqu to Joe Ianotti (center) as Mrs.

Aepiid — CTVUSH MEIANIVId/ONVIS! GIW — LL se

And now for all you

“Broadwayite heed the &l

announceme that the

Galileo Lodg will be th =

scene of ‘The Other Vic 8
Theatre Company stagin —

of a play that deals with an

adulteress love affair.. Play
consists of six comedic

i rsed bet-

ween each scene the au-

dience will be treated to a

nostalgic music and slide

show depicting America

from the 1940’ to the 1970’s

The plac is the Galileo

Lodge the time is Sunda

(Continued on Pag 9)

5
BONDE

blades
~~ x

IL N

SWOCero
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SHAMPOO OR

CONDITIONER

ALL TYPES
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AVAILABL AT YOUR

LOCAL
FOR

GAL (616) 239-6615

AVAILABLE AT:

PICKER PHY

Lynbrook

ARGO CHEMISTS
Elmont

BIRCHWOOD PHY

Westbur

DOGWOOD CHEMISTS
Franklin Squer

CARLE PLACE CHEMIS
Carle Place
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KANTOR PHY. ,
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MANOR DRUGS
East Meadow

MIDWAY PHY.

Westbur

MINEOLA PHY.
Mineola

J.J. SMITH PHY.
Levittown
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Kiwanis T Distribute
Chees Sa Ap 23

The Kiwanis Foundation

of. Hicksville will be distri-

buting free cheese to senior

citizens who qualify and

who reside in the area of

Hicksville (an environ

Every senior citizen must

hav first filed a need form. |

These form are available at |

the Hicksville Public
Library on Jerusalem:

Avenue. The Kiwanian
have agree to hel b being

the aistrioutive agent in this

government project.
The free chees will be dis-

tributed beginnin at [1 am

on Sat., April 23 in the park-
in lot of the Hicksville
Veterans of Foreign Wars,

which is located one half

mile south of Old Country-
Road on Broadway.
Hicksville.

If there are.any questions
you may phon 938-360 or

&quot;785

eee

Aroun Ou Towns
Lynda Noeth Scotti — 796-1286 Harriet A. Maher — 433-5994

Marie. Best wishes to you.
2 * *

The Peters housheld also

had a birthday celebrant in

April...Doree Peters who
turned 18 years old. On hand
for the event were her

Hicksville Ann Gros is just
bursting with pride. Her

granddaughter, Dawn

Williams, is graduatin 14th
out of a class of 700 in the

Linderhurst High School.

Dawn& parents, Clifford and

Rose Williams, are as plea
ed as Ann Gros about their

~

Parol Announ Route 10 Improvement

Assemblyma Fred Par
ola of Wantag said today
that Zara Corporation of

* Hicksville has been awarded.

the state contract and will

§ it’s easy. Just send your

secretary Teleflora&# Make-

U Mirror Bouquet A

& stylish two-sided make-
S mirror with a containe full

§ of colorful fres flowers. |

Onquic call to our sho

an we& deliver your speci

PPAR P

with speci

begin work within the

month to improv Route

107 between Hempstead
Turnpike and Lewis Street.

North of Hempstead

Secretarie Week is Apri
24-30.Sen the FTD&

Secretaries Week
Bouque

S
is
8

Sen your thought

oo)
‘

f

8

ge 8

a
R
s
8
8
a 5

a
si

CERN U CELE)
S Hicksville * 931-024 S

a
. ,
8
u

Samm ERNny GOEDEL aE eS

°

935-9759

~

I YOU SERVI ....

Here you& find

personabl operators with

the most experienced skills

| 1 W. MARI S

822-3486

,
MICKSVILLE

Seal

area

Turnpike, Route 10 will be

widened into four lanes,

except where it is alread
divided.

The contract includes

improvemen to the inter-

section of Courtney Lan
and Hempstea Turnpike
which has been the scene of

many accidents due to

inadequat traffic signals

Various other safety
improvements will be

added, including new traffic

signal better drainag rel-

ocation of poles and

landscapin

Assemblyman Parola

expressed appreciation to

the residents of Hicksville.

Bethpage and Island Trees

who wrote letters to con-

vince the state Departmen
of Transportation of the

priority need of the project
“lam please that the

DO is addressin our traf-

fic and safet problem
along this well-traveled

route,” Parol concluded.

“The project is to be com-

pleted by the end of the

year.”

Hats off to our first East
St. PTA jumpers! (Top row

- L to R) Karen Rice,
Myriam DelaFuente,

daughter&# ac-

complishments Good luck to

you, Dawn:
* *

And on April 5 our own
~

Hicksville resident, Martha

Masseria, celebrated her

birthday. Her mom, Sarah

Cucci, held aparty for Mar-

tha in Brooklyn. Among the

guests at this festivity were

Martha’s husband, Bernie.

their two sons, Joe and

Mark, her sister, brother, in-
laws and lots of friends.

* * *

Congratulations to Skip
Ference who celebrated his

38th birthday on April 16

Skip said he ha a quie bir-

thday, but we learned a

delightful birthday party
was held for Skip by his

family.

* * *

We couldn’t miss con-

gratulating Jan and Frank

White on their 30th weddin
anniversary. The White’s

were married on April 11

1953...and it seems like only
yesterda to them. Best

wishes, folks.
* *

The Jopps, Betty and

Frank, though their wed-

ding anniversary would slip
by us unnoticed. But we

found our about it and can&#

overlook wishing this charm-

in coupl many more years
of caring and sharing with

each other. Betty and Frank

were married 33 years on

April 16.
* * *

Along with April showers

and flowers, April brings
many birthday and wedding

Norma Goerke. (Bot. row -L

to R) Millie Hubert and

Rosemarie Jabour.

parents, Ann and Dick, and

her brothers, Richard and
anniversaries for our Michael. Hope you had a

Hicksvillites. Christine marvelous: birthday
Hirsch celebrated her se- Doreen.

~

cond birthday on April 19 * * .

Helping her celebrate were

her parents Joan and Ken-&

neth, her brother, K.C.

(Kenneth), and h sister,
Janet. Naturally her grand
parents. Alma and Artie

Hirsch came to join in on the

fun.
* * *

Ther will be another wed-

din anniversary celebrated
in Hicksville on April 25. The

happ coupl are Janet and
Frank Gioia who will be

married 13 years. The Gioias

are planning a family party
including their three

children, Anthony,
Christopher and Dana

LEGAL NOTICE

NOTICE OF

PUBLIC HEARING
BY THE BOARD

OF APPEALS
Pursuant to the provi-

sions of Art - Div. 3 Sec-

tion 67 of the Building Zone

Ordinance, Notice is hereb
give that the Board of

Appeal will hold a Public

Hearing in the Town Hall,

Building Meeting
Room, Audrey Avenue,

Oyste Bay New York on

THURSDAY Evening,
April 28, 1983 at 8:00 P.M.

to consider the following

East

cases;

PLAIN VIEW:
83-155 LORETTA D‘OT-

TONE: Variance to convert

existing garage into habita-

ble area with less than the

required aggregate side

yard S/s/ 0 Stewart Street,

215.0 ft. W/o Lincoln

Road East

83-161 CENTURY CIR-° PM.
CUIT.” The public is invited to

Board of

Fire Commissioners
Arthur Kroll,

Secty, 4/14/83
M-4614-1T 4 22 MID

.
INC.: Variance to

erect a ground sig with

greater area and heigh than

allowed b Ordinance and

exceedin number of sign
allowed. N/E/Cor. South

Oyster Ba Road and

Woodbury Road.

83-164: MOBIL OIL

COMPANY: Variance to

erect a building for storage
With less than the require
rear yard W/s/o Manetto

Hill Road, 376 ft. S/o
Library Lane.

BY ORDER
OF THE BOARD

OF APPEALS
Town of

Oyster Bay
OYSTER BAY,
NEW YORK

April 18 1983

PagigetT4)22PL
NOTICE IS HEREBY

GIVEN that liquor license
be 6 OP 2748 has been

COMPLETE
CATERING

FACILITIES

VUE
RETIREMENT PARTY

PRIVATE PARTY

@ SHOWER PARTY

ENGAGEMENT PARTY}

REUNION PARTY

CALL FOR
SPECIA
MON.- PRICE

Eor Ol conp nieksvi O 1-3300

issued to the undersigne to

sel beer, liquor and/or wine
under the Alcoholic Bever-

age Control Law at 36
South Oyste Ba Road,
Plainview, Nassau County,
New York, for on-
consumptio

W.J.J.C. INC.

d/b/a THE OTHER
- PLACE

36 South Oyste Ba Road
Plainview

,
NY 11803

P-4611- 2T 4/2 Pl

Congratulations to Mr. and .

Mrs. Kevin McGrath of

HICKSVILLE, who are the

prou parent of their first

child, Kerry-Jill McGrath
born on April 1 at the

Nassau County Medical
Center in East Meadow,
weighing in at 7 lbs., 14 oz.

Proud grandparent are Mr.

and Mrs. William Moyer and

Mr. and Mrs. David
McGrath, all of Hicksville.

* * *

Congratulation to Mr. and

Mrs. Henry Brengel of
HICKSVILLE, who recently
celebrated their 63rd wed-

ding anniversary.

Mrs. John L. Cuche of

Hicksville is please to

announce the engagement of

her daughter, Alexis, to Mr.

Christopher J. Nagowski
son of Mr. and Mrs. John

Nagowsk of Cheektowaga.
New York.

Both graduate of S.U.C.

at Fredonia, Alexis i work-

ing as an elementary substi-
tute teacher in Hicksville,

and Christoph is an engi
neer for Monitor Aerospac
Corporatio in Amityville

A Septembe weddin is

planned.

LEGAL NOTI

NOTICE IS HEREBY
GIVEN that the annual

Inspectio of Uniforms-and

Equipment of the Jericho

Fire Department will be

held on April 30, 1983, at

Fire Headquarters at 5:30

attend.

——
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